

ESM Solutions - Sourcing
- Line Item Bid

Event ID B20023
Refuse & Recyclable
Event Name Material Collection
Section Name Standard Line Item
Section Attachments

Supplier Name	Item Number (Required - Entity)	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Quantity (Required - Entity)	Unit Bid Price (Required - Supplier)	Extended Bid Price (Required - Supplier)	Notes	SupplierNotes	NoBid
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE: Leased 30 cubic yard compactor; Campus	1	\$ 174.00	\$ 174.00			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	DISPOSAL CHARGE (COST/TON): Leased 30 cubic yard compactor;	1	\$ 46.00	\$ 46.00			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	RENTAL FEE: Leased 30 cubic yard compactor; Campus Center solid	1	\$ 174.00	\$ 174.00			No
Republic Services of Joliet	MAIN CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: Leased co-mingled 6 cubic yard front load compactor; J-Building loading dock recycling, 2x/week (M,	1	\$ 175.00	\$ 175.00			No
Republic Services of Joliet	MAIN CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS RENTAL FEE: Leased co-mingled 6 cubic yard front load compactor; J-Building loading dock recycling, 2x/week (M, TH)	1	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00			No
Republic Services of Joliet	MAIN CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: Leased co-mingled 6 cubic yard front load compactor; J-Building loading dock recycling, 2x/week (M,	1	\$ 175.00	\$ 175.00			No
Republic Services of Joliet	MAIN CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS RENTAL FEE: Leased co-mingled 6 cubic yard front load compactor; J-Building loading dock recycling, 2x/week (M, TH)	1	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: 8 cubic yard front load; J-building	1	\$ 390.00	\$ 390.00			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: 8 cubic yard front load; J-building	1	\$ 299.00	\$ 299.00			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE:20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned mixed metal	1	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	DISPOSAL CHARGE (COST/TON): 20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned mixed	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE:20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned mixed wood	1	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	DISPOSAL CHARGE (COST/TON): 20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned wood	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE:20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned	1	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	DISPOSAL CHARGE (COST/TON): 20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned	1	\$ 46.00	\$ 46.00			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE: 2 cubic yard front load; K-building solid waste,	1	\$ 16.50	\$ 16.50			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE: 2 cubic yard front load; C-building Auto Shop	1	\$ 16.50	\$ 16.50			No
Republic Services of	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE: 2 cubic yard front load; greenhouse solid	1	\$ 16.50	\$ 16.50			No
Republic Services of Joliet	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE PER BALE PALLET: Campus Center bales cardboard, on call basis	1	\$ -	\$ -		Minimum pick up of 8 bales - \$100 fee would apply if less than 8 bales	No
Republic Services of	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: Leased 6 cubic yard front load	1	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00			No
Republic Services of Joliet	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS RENTAL FEE: Leased 6 cubic yard front load compactor solid waste, gated area, 2x/week (T, F)	1	\$ 395.00	\$ 395.00		6yd FL Compactor is 1.5yd IND compactor with doghouse and side load capability - 6yd is	No
Republic Services of	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: Leased 6 cubic yard front load	1	\$ 300.00	\$ 300.00			No
Republic Services of	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS RENTAL FEE: Leased 6 cubic yard front load	1	\$ 395.00	\$ 395.00			No
Republic Services of	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 62.50	\$ 125.00			No
Republic Services of	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 62.50	\$ 125.00			No
Republic Services of	CITY CENTER CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 137.50	\$ 275.00			No
Republic Services of	CITY CENTER CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 105.00	\$ 210.00			No
Republic Services of	CITY CENTER CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 125.00	\$ 250.00			No
Republic Services of	CITY CENTER CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 97.50	\$ 195.00			No
Republic Services of	WEITENDORF CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE: 6 cubic yard front load solid waste, on call	1	\$ 30.00	\$ 30.00			No
Republic Services of Joliet	MIXED METAL CREDIT/REBATE	Per bid specifications, enter the fixed credit/rebate per pickup if applicable. If not applicable, please check the box under the 'no bid'	1	\$ -	\$ -			No

Supplier Name	Item Number (Required - Entity)	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Quantity (Required - Entity)	Unit Bid Price (Required - Supplier)	Extended Bid Price (Required - Supplier)	Notes	SupplierNotes	NoBid
Republic Services of Joliet	MIXED METAL CREDIT/REBATE	Per bid specifications, enter the per pound/ton credit/rebate amount if applicable. If not applicable, please check the box under the 'no bid' column for this line item.	1	\$ -	\$ -	-		No
Republic Services of Joliet	CARDBOARD BALE PURCHASES	Per bid specifications, enter the credit/rebate amount for bale and palletized cardboard bundles. Please also describe how the credit will be calculated in the notes column of this line item. If not applicable, please check the box under the 'no bid' column for this line item.	1	\$ -	\$ -	-	See notes above - rebate would be based on guarantee of at least minimum of 8 bales per month - Highside of OBM minus \$45 per ton - if monthly minimum is	No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: Four (4) yard	1	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: Four (4) yard	1	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: Four (4) yard	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: Four (4) yard	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 20.00	\$ 20.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 40.00	\$ 40.00			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard mixed metal	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard mixed metal	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard mixed metal	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard mixed metal	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard mixed wood	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard mixed wood	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard mixed wood	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard mixed wood	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard C/D	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard C/D	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard mixed C/D	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard mixed C/D	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Republic Services of	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	WEEKDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00			No
Republic Services of	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	WEEKDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE RECYCLING: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00			No
Republic Services of	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	SATURDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00			No
Republic Services of	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	SATURDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE RECYCLING: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.00			No
Republic Services of	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	WEEKDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00			No
Republic Services of	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	WEEKDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE RECYCLING: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00			No
Republic Services of	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	SATURDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00			No
Republic Services of	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	SATURDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE RECYCLING: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 35.00	\$ 35.00			No
Republic Services of	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	WEEKDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00			No
Republic Services of	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	SATURDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE: Leased 30 cubic yard compactor; Campus	1	\$ 100.00	\$ 100.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	DISPOSAL CHARGE (COST/TON): Leased 30 cubic yard compactor;	1	\$ 49.00	\$ 49.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	RENTAL FEE: Leased 30 cubic yard compactor; Campus Center solid	1	\$ 298.00	\$ 298.00			No

Supplier Name	Item Number (Required - Entity)	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Quantity (Required - Entity)	Unit Bid Price (Required - Supplier)	Extended Bid Price (Required - Supplier)	Notes	SupplierNotes	NoBid
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: Leased co-mingled 6 cubic yard front load compactor; J-Building loading dock recycling, 2x/week (M,	1	\$ 240.00	\$ 240.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS RENTAL FEE: Leased co-mingled 6 cubic yard front load compactor; J-Building loading dock recycling, 2x/week (M, TH)	1	\$ 130.00	\$ 130.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: Leased co-mingled 6 cubic yard front load compactor; J-Building loading dock recycling, 2x/week (M,	1	\$ 240.00	\$ 240.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS RENTAL FEE: Leased co-mingled 6 cubic yard front load compactor; J-Building loading dock recycling, 2x/week (M, TH)	1	\$ 130.00	\$ 130.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: 8 cubic yard front load; J-building	1	\$ 390.00	\$ 390.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: 8 cubic yard front load; J-building	1	\$ 320.00	\$ 320.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE:20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned mixed metal	1	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	DISPOSAL CHARGE (COST/TON): 20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned mixed	1	\$ 49.00	\$ 49.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE:20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned mixed wood	1	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	DISPOSAL CHARGE (COST/TON): 20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned wood	1	\$ 49.00	\$ 49.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE:20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned	1	\$ 85.00	\$ 85.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	DISPOSAL CHARGE (COST/TON): 20 cubic yard roll off; JJC owned	1	\$ 49.00	\$ 49.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE: 2 cubic yard front load; K-building solid waste,	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE: 2 cubic yard front load; C-building Auto Shop	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE: 2 cubic yard front load; greenhouse solid	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	MAIN CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE PER BALE PALLET: Campus Center bales cardboard, on call basis	1	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00		Minimum of 6-bales.	No
Waste Management	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: Leased 6 cubic yard front load	1	\$ 325.00	\$ 325.00			No
Waste Management	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS RENTAL FEE: Leased 6 cubic yard front load	1	\$ 130.00	\$ 130.00			No
Waste Management	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE: Leased 6 cubic yard front load	1	\$ 325.00	\$ 325.00			No
Waste Management	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS RENTAL FEE: Leased 6 cubic yard front load	1	\$ 130.00	\$ 130.00			No
Waste Management	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 95.00	\$ 190.00			No
Waste Management	ROMEOVILLE CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 95.00	\$ 190.00			No
Waste Management	CITY CENTER CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 175.00	\$ 350.00			No
Waste Management	CITY CENTER CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 145.00	\$ 290.00			No
Waste Management	CITY CENTER CAMPUS	REGULAR PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 195.00	\$ 390.00			No
Waste Management	CITY CENTER CAMPUS	SUMMER PICKUPS MONTHLY RATE PER CONTAINER: 2 cubic yard front	2	\$ 160.00	\$ 320.00			No
Waste Management	WEITENDORF CAMPUS	PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE: 6 cubic yard front load solid waste, on call	1	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00			No
Waste Management	MIXED METAL CREDIT/REBATE	Per bid specifications, enter the fixed credit/rebate per pickup if applicable. If not applicable, please check the box under the 'no bid'	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Waste Management	MIXED METAL CREDIT/REBATE	Per bid specifications, enter the per pound/ton credit/rebate amount if applicable. If not applicable, please check the box under the 'no bid' column for this line item.	1	\$ -	\$ -		Rebate will come from the metal hauler. we will bring to the scrap hauler. they will rebate	No
Waste Management	CARDBOARD BALE PURCHASES	Per bid specifications, enter the credit/rebate amount for bale and palletized cardboard bundles. Please also describe how the credit will be calculated in the notes column of this line item. If not applicable, please check the box under the 'no bid' column for	1	\$ 90.00	\$ 90.00		WM will rebate HS - \$30.00 per ton. Currently market is at \$120.00. If Market changes this will reflect	No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: Four (4) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: Four (4) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: Four (4) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: Four (4) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No

Supplier Name	Item Number (Required - Entity)	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Quantity (Required - Entity)	Unit Bid Price (Required - Supplier)	Extended Bid Price (Required - Supplier)	Notes	SupplierNotes	NoBid
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard mixed metal	1	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard mixed metal	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard mixed metal	1	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard mixed metal	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard mixed wood	1	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard mixed wood	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard mixed wood	1	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard mixed wood	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard C/D	1	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	WEEKDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard C/D	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY DELIVERY FEE: 20 yard mixed C/D	1	\$ 50.00	\$ 50.00			No
Waste Management	ADD'L CONTAINER	SATURDAY REMOVAL FEE: 20 yard mixed C/D	1	\$ -	\$ -			No
Waste Management	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	WEEKDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	WEEKDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE RECYCLING: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	SATURDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	SATURDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE RECYCLING: Two (2) yard	1	\$ 25.00	\$ 25.00			No
Waste Management	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	WEEKDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00			No
Waste Management	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	WEEKDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE RECYCLING: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00			No
Waste Management	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	SATURDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00			No
Waste Management	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	SATURDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE RECYCLING: Six (6) yard	1	\$ 60.00	\$ 60.00			No
Waste Management	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	WEEKDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 80.00	\$ 80.00			No
Waste Management	ADDITIONAL PICKUP	SATURDAY PICKUP FEE/HAUL RATE SOLID WASTE: Eight (8) yard	1	\$ 80.00	\$ 80.00			No