

ESM Solutions - Sourcing - Line Item Bid

Event ID B18039  
 Event Name Vending, Fountain, and Bottled Beverage Services  
 Section Name Standard Line Item Pricing  
 Section Description  
 Section Attachments

Supplier Name	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Selling Price (Required - Entity)	Commission % (Required - Supplier)	SupplierNotes	NoBid
Canteen Vending Services	Annual Lump Sum Payment	(intentionally left blank)	Option A1 \$36,000 for up to length of contract Option A2 \$14,000 for up to the length of the contract	a. Option A1: If we partner on the Vending and Snack the commission will be 30%. As a show of good faith and to eliminate any risk for JJC; we would guarantee your yearly commission of \$36,000 up front in one lump sum payment for up to 5 years (length of the contract). E.g. if JJC wanted the upfront payment for 5 years we would pay the school \$180,000 up front. In addition we would continue to pay JJC a 30% commission rate after you hit your revenue goals. b. Option A2: If we partner with JJC for snack vending only we would offer JJC a 25% commission rate. As a show of good faith and to eliminate any risk for JJC; we would guarantee your yearly commission of \$14,000 up front in one lump sum payment for up to 5 years (length of the contract). E.g. if JJC wanted the upfront payment for 5 years we would pay the school \$70,000 up front. In addition we would continue to pay JJC a 25% commission rate after you hit your revenue goals.	No
Canteen Vending Services	Bottled Beverages – Energy Drink 16oz	\$3.50	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Bottled Beverages – Juice	\$2.25	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Bottled Beverages – Soda/Water	\$1.75	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Bottled Beverages – Cappuccino 13.7oz	\$3.50	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Bottled Beverages – Gatorade/Juice	\$2.25	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Candy	\$1.30	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Gum & Mints	\$0.75	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Hot Beverage	\$0.65	25-30	Option A1 Snack and soda at 30% Option A2 snack only 25%	No
Canteen Vending Services	Hot Beverage	\$0.75	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Hot Beverage	\$0.80	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Hot Beverage	\$0.90	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.00	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.25	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.50	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$2.25	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes

Supplier Name	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Selling Price (Required - Entity)	Commission % (Required - Supplier)	SupplierNotes	NoBid
Canteen Vending Services	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  16 oz Energy Drink Can, \$2.99			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  18.5 oz Pure Leaf Tea, \$2.30			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  12 oz Soda Can, \$1.00			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  13.7 oz Frappuccino, \$3.22			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  15.2 oz Juice, \$2.30			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Gatorade, \$2.07			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz SOBE Life Water, \$2.30			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Soda, \$1.61			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Water, \$1.61			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  9.5 oz Frappuccino, \$2.53			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTIONAL	A-Building Water & Ice Machine Dispenser			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTIONAL	If the College requires a performance bond for the 1st year commission revenues and lump sum payment, indicate the cost for this bond in the next column to the right.  If no costs, please select 'no bid'			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Carbon dioxide 50 lb.			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Syrups 5 gal & 3 gal Bag in Box (variety of 12)			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide the make and model of the proposed ice machines in the next column			Yes
Canteen Vending Services	Pastry	\$1.45	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Snacks/Chips	\$0.95	25-30		No
Canteen Vending Services	Snacks/Chips	\$1.20	25-30		No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Annual Lump Sum Payment	(intentionally left blank)		\$40,000	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Bottled Beverages – Energy Drink 16oz	\$3.50	40	Monster Energy/NOS/Full Throttle	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Bottled Beverages – Juice	\$2.25	40	Minute Maid	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Bottled Beverages – Soda/Water	\$1.75	40		No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Bottled Beverages – Cappuccino 13.7oz	\$3.50	40	Dunkin Donuts Iced Coffee's	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Bottled Beverages – Gatorade/Juice	\$2.25	40	Powerade	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Candy	\$1.30			Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Gum & Mints	\$0.75			Yes

Supplier Name	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Selling Price (Required - Entity)	Commission % (Required - Supplier)	SupplierNotes	NoBid
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Hot Beverage	\$0.65			Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Hot Beverage	\$0.75			Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Hot Beverage	\$0.80			Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Hot Beverage	\$0.90			Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.00			Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.25			Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.50			Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$2.25			Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'		\$12,070 Off-invoice rebates on fountain and bottle/can beverages paid yearly. Estimates based on provided volume.	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'		\$10,000 1st year only sign-on bonus	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'		\$2,500 Raffles, Prizes, Sampling Events, yearly	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'		\$1,000 PowerAde Sideline Kits, yearly	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  16 oz Energy Drink Can, \$2.99		\$1.56	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  18.5 oz Pure Leaf Tea, \$2.30		\$1.18 Gold Peak	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  12 oz Soda Can, \$1.00		\$0.42	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  13.7 oz Frappuccino, \$3.22		\$1.63 Dunkin Donuts Iced Coffee	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  15.2 oz Juice, \$2.30		\$0.96 We do not sell 15.2oz Juice, price listed for 12oz Minute Maid Juice.	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Gatorade, \$2.07		\$0.76 Powerade	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz SOBE Life Water, \$2.30		\$1.18 Vitamin Water	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Soda, \$1.61		\$0.85	No

Supplier Name	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Selling Price (Required - Entity)	Commission % (Required - Supplier)	SupplierNotes	NoBid
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Water, \$1.61	\$0.42	Dasani	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  9.5 oz Frappuccino, \$2.53	No comparable size	Dunkin Donuts Iced Coffee as mentioned above.	No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTIONAL	A-Building Water & Ice Machine Dispenser			Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTIONAL	If the College requires a performance bond for the 1st year commission revenues and lump sum payment, indicate the cost for this bond in the next column to the right.  If no costs, please select 'no bid'			Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Carbon dioxide 50 lb.	\$21.00 fill, requires \$75.00 deposit. Only 20lb CO2 provided.		No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Syrups 5 gal & 3 gal Bag in Box (variety of 12)	5 Gal - \$80.30, 2.5 Gal - \$41.85. Core products offered in 5 Gal, flavors offered in 2.5 Gal		No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide the make and model of the proposed ice machines in the next column	Hoshizaki KMD-901M_H		No
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Pastry		\$1.45		Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Snacks/Chips		\$0.95		Yes
Great Lakes Coca-Cola Bottling	Snacks/Chips		\$1.20		Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	Annual Lump Sum Payment	(intentionally left blank)			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	Bottled Beverages – Energy Drink 16oz		\$3.50	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Bottled Beverages – Juice		\$2.25	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Bottled Beverages – Soda/Water		\$1.75	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Bottled Beverages – Cappuccino 13.7oz		\$3.50	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Bottled Beverages – Gatorade/Juice		\$2.25	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Candy		\$1.30	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Gum & Mints		\$0.75	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Hot Beverage		\$0.65	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Hot Beverage		\$0.75	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Hot Beverage		\$0.80	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Hot Beverage		\$0.90	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Ice Cream/Frozen Products		\$1.00	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Ice Cream/Frozen Products		\$1.25	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Ice Cream/Frozen Products		\$1.50	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Ice Cream/Frozen Products		\$2.25	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'	\$3000.00 annual payment to the College. Payments made every year of the agreement on the date of your choice and to be used as you wish		No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'	\$300.00 worth of promotional items annually to be delivered on the date of your choice and to be used as you wish. This value amount can also be made in a cash payment		No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes

Supplier Name	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Selling Price (Required - Entity)	Commission % (Required - Supplier)	SupplierNotes	NoBid
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  16 oz Energy Drink Can, \$2.99			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  18.5 oz Pure Leaf Tea, \$2.30			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  12 oz Soda Can, \$1.00			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  13.7 oz Frappuccino, \$3.22			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  15.2 oz Juice, \$2.30			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Gatorade, \$2.07			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz SOBE Life Water, \$2.30			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Soda, \$1.61			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Water, \$1.61			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  9.5 oz Frappuccino, \$2.53			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTIONAL	A-Building Water & Ice Machine Dispenser			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTIONAL	If the College requires a performance bond for the 1st year commission revenues and lump sum payment, indicate the cost for this bond in the next column to the right.  If no costs, please select 'no bid'	\$0.00		No
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Carbon dioxide 50 lb.			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Syrups 5 gal & 3 gal Bag in Box (variety of 12)			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide the make and model of the proposed ice machines in the next column			Yes
Hometown Suburban Vending	Pastry		\$1.45	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Snacks/Chips		\$0.95	31.5	No
Hometown Suburban Vending	Snacks/Chips		\$1.20	31.5	No
InstaHealthy	Annual Lump Sum Payment	(intentionally left blank)			Yes
InstaHealthy	Bottled Beverages – Energy Drink 16oz		\$3.50	15	No
InstaHealthy	Bottled Beverages – Juice		\$2.25	15	No
InstaHealthy	Bottled Beverages – Soda/Water		\$1.75	15	No
InstaHealthy	Bottled Beverages – Cappuccino 13.7oz		\$3.50	15	No
InstaHealthy	Bottled Beverages – Gatorade/Juice		\$2.25	15	No
InstaHealthy	Candy		\$1.30	15	No
InstaHealthy	Gum & Mints		\$0.75	15	No

Supplier Name	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Selling Price (Required - Entity)	Commission % (Required - Supplier)	SupplierNotes	NoBid
InstaHealthy	Hot Beverage	\$0.65			Yes
InstaHealthy	Hot Beverage	\$0.75			Yes
InstaHealthy	Hot Beverage	\$0.80			Yes
InstaHealthy	Hot Beverage	\$0.90			Yes
InstaHealthy	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.00			Yes
InstaHealthy	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.25			Yes
InstaHealthy	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.50			Yes
InstaHealthy	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$2.25			Yes
InstaHealthy	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes
InstaHealthy	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes
InstaHealthy	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes
InstaHealthy	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  16 oz Energy Drink Can, \$2.99			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  18.5 oz Pure Leaf Tea, \$2.30			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  12 oz Soda Can, \$1.00			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  13.7 oz Frappuccino, \$3.22			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  15.2 oz Juice, \$2.30			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Gatorade, \$2.07			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz SOBE Life Water, \$2.30			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Soda, \$1.61			Yes

Supplier Name	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Selling Price (Required - Entity)	Commission % (Required - Supplier)	SupplierNotes	NoBid
InstaHealthy	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Water, \$1.61			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  9.5 oz Frappuccino, \$2.53			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Carbon dioxide 50 lb.			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Syrups 5 gal & 3 gal Bag in Box (variety of 12)			Yes
InstaHealthy	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide the make and model of the proposed ice machines in the next column			Yes
InstaHealthy	Pastry	\$1.45	15		No
InstaHealthy	Snacks/Chips	\$0.95	15		No
InstaHealthy	Snacks/Chips	\$1.20	15		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	Annual Lump Sum Payment	(intentionally left blank)		\$25,000 Annual Sponsorship to be paid within 60 days of the anniversary date of contract every year of the agreement	No
PepsiCo Foodservice	Bottled Beverages – Energy Drink 16oz	\$3.50	45		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	Bottled Beverages – Juice	\$2.25	45		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	Bottled Beverages – Soda/Water	\$1.75	45		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	Bottled Beverages – Cappuccino 13.7oz	\$3.50	45		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	Bottled Beverages – Gatorade/Juice	\$2.25	45		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	Candy	\$1.30			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Gum & Mints	\$0.75			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Hot Beverage	\$0.65			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Hot Beverage	\$0.75			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Hot Beverage	\$0.80			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Hot Beverage	\$0.90			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.00			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.25			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.50			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$2.25			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'		\$1,500 per year Marketing Support to be used at the discretion of the college for any on-campus needs (i.e Spring Fling Raffle, Sustainability Initiatives, etc.)	No
PepsiCo Foodservice	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  16 oz Energy Drink Can, \$2.99		\$1.00 Rockstar Brands	No

Supplier Name	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Selling Price (Required - Entity)	Commission % (Required - Supplier)	SupplierNotes	NoBid
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  18.5 oz Pure Leaf Tea, \$2.30	\$1.15		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  12 oz Soda Can, \$1.00	0.40c		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  13.7 oz Frappuccino, \$3.22	\$1.90		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  15.2 oz Juice, \$2.30	Ambient - \$1.05, Premium Chilled - \$2.10		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Gatorade, \$2.07	0.96c		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz SOBE Life Water, \$2.30	\$1.22		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Soda, \$1.61	0.73c		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Water, \$1.61	0.57c		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  9.5 oz Frappuccino, \$2.53	\$2.47		No
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTIONAL	A-Building Water & Ice Machine Dispenser			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTIONAL	If the College requires a performance bond for the 1st year commission revenues and lump sum payment, indicate the cost for this bond in the next column to the right.  If no costs, please select 'no bid'			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Carbon dioxide 50 lb.	\$71.70	While this price reflects a 50lb cost, we only deliver 20lb tanks at a cost of \$28.68	No
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Syrups 5 gal & 3 gal Bag in Box (variety of 12)	\$1 rebate per Gallon, pricing entered in Supplier Notes	Pepsi 5G \$14.63/gal, Dr Pepper 5G \$14.60/gal, Trop lemonade 3G \$12.05/gal, Diet Pepsi 5G \$14.63/gal, Pepsi WC 3G \$15.13/gal, Lipton Brisk 3G \$12.05/gal, Mt Dew 5G \$14.63/gal, Dt Dr Pepper 3G \$15.23/gal, Lipton Iced Tea Sweet \$17.65/gal, Mug/Mist/Crush 3G \$15.13/gal, SoBe Lifewater 3G \$14.84/gal	No
PepsiCo Foodservice	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide the make and model of the proposed ice machines in the next column	Hoshizaki KMD-410AH	Hoshizaki KMD-410AH	No
PepsiCo Foodservice	Pastry	\$1.45			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Snacks/Chips	\$0.95			Yes
PepsiCo Foodservice	Snacks/Chips	\$1.20			Yes
Yami Vending Inc	Annual Lump Sum Payment	(intentionally left blank)	Annual Sponsorship Yami Vending Inc. \$9,000.00 Annual Sponsorship Keurig Dr. Pepper \$16,000.00	With respect to Year 1, Yami Vending Inc. the annual sponsorship funds will be payable to customer within (45) forty-five days of signed agreement by both parties; thereafter the annual sponsorship funds will be payable within sixty (60) days of the commencement of each Year. Keurig Dr. Pepper will prorate years 2-5 based on account volume of reaching 3,600/24 ct cases	No
Yami Vending Inc	Bottled Beverages – Energy Drink 16oz	\$3.50	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Bottled Beverages – Juice	\$2.25	45		No

Supplier Name	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Selling Price (Required - Entity)	Commission % (Required - Supplier)	SupplierNotes	NoBid
Yami Vending Inc	Bottled Beverages – Soda/Water	\$1.75	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Bottled Beverages – Cappuccino 13.7oz	\$3.50	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Bottled Beverages – Gatorade/Juice	\$2.25	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Candy	\$1.30	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Gum & Mints	\$0.75	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Hot Beverage	\$0.65	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Hot Beverage	\$0.75	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Hot Beverage	\$0.80	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Hot Beverage	\$0.90	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.00	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.25	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$1.50	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Ice Cream/Frozen Products	\$2.25	45		No
Yami Vending Inc	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'	Yami Vending Inc. \$500.00	Donated Products. Dispersed each year throughout the term across the facilities upon request of the customer.	No
Yami Vending Inc	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'	Yami Vending Inc. \$1,500.00	Annual Scholarship paid to JJC on September 1st of each year during the contract term.	No
Yami Vending Inc	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'	Yami Vending Inc. \$1,000.00 Keurig Dr. Pepper \$1,000.00	Annual merchandising Support. Dispersed each year throughout the term to be spent by both Yami Vending Inc. and Keurig Dr. Pepper for promotional items, raffle items and samplings.	No
Yami Vending Inc	Institutional Support	Dollar Value: Enter the dollar value in the next column to the right.  Description & Frequency: Enter the description as well as When/Where/How Offered in the notes section. For any unneeded lines, please select 'no bid'	Keurig Dr. Pepper \$1.50 rebate on all 24 ct. cases and \$1.00 rebate per gallon on fountain products.		No
Yami Vending Inc	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  16 oz Energy Drink Can, \$2.99	\$12.00 - 24 qty. case, \$16.00 - 12 qty. case and \$20.40 - 12 qty. case respectively. See attachment.	Alternate brand. See attachment.	No
Yami Vending Inc	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Before tax selling price is listed for reference.  18.5 oz Pure Leaf Tea, \$2.30	\$10.88 per 12 qty. case	Alternate brand. See attachment	No
Yami Vending Inc	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  12 oz Soda Can, \$1.00	\$8.85 per 24 qty. case	Alternate brand. See attachment.	No
Yami Vending Inc	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  13.7 oz Frappuccino, \$3.22	Peet's Coffee \$21.48 per 12 qty. case - 8 oz.	Alternate brand. See attachment.	No
Yami Vending Inc	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  15.2 oz Juice, \$2.30	\$15.04 per 12 qty. case		No
Yami Vending Inc	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Gatorade, \$2.07	\$22.60 per 24 qty. case		No
Yami Vending Inc	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz SOBE Life Water, \$2.30	BAI - \$18.60 per 12 qty. case - 18 oz.	Alternate brand. See attachment.	No

Supplier Name	Item/Service (Required - Entity)	Selling Price (Required - Entity)	Commission % (Required - Supplier)	SupplierNotes	NoBid
Yami Vending Inc	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Soda, \$1.61	\$24.00 per 24 qty. case	Alternate brand. See attachment	No
Yami Vending Inc	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  20 oz Water, \$1.61	\$16.56 per 24 qty. case	Alternate brand. See attachment.	No
Yami Vending Inc	OPTION 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1 or 2  Any alternate brands and sizes must be mentioned in the notes column of the corresponding line item.	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column. Current before tax selling price is listed for reference.  9.5 oz Frappuccino, \$2.53	High Brew Coffee \$19.50 per 12 qty. case - 8 oz.	Alternate brand. See attachment.	No
Yami Vending Inc	OPTIONAL	A-Building Water & Ice Machine Dispenser			Yes
Yami Vending Inc	OPTIONAL	If the College requires a performance bond for the 1st year commission revenues and lump sum payment, indicate the cost for this bond in the next column to the right.  If no costs, please select 'no bid'			Yes
Yami Vending Inc	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Carbon dioxide 50 lb.			Yes
Yami Vending Inc	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide our cost for the following in the next column:  Syrups 5 gal & 3 gal Bag in Box (variety of 12)	5 GAL \$78.75 / 2.5 GAL \$41.05	Alternate brand. Keurig Dr. Pepper \$1.50 rebate on all 24 ct. cases and \$1.00 rebate per gallon on fountain products.	No
Yami Vending Inc	OPTIONS 2 & 3 ONLY Select 'no bid' for this line if bidding on option 1	Please provide the make and model of the proposed ice machines in the next column	Ice-O-Matic MDL# CIM032HA		No
Yami Vending Inc	Pastry		\$1.45	45	No
Yami Vending Inc	Snacks/Chips		\$0.95	45	No
Yami Vending Inc	Snacks/Chips		\$1.20	45	No