
Joliet Junior College

Quote for Purchase & Installation of Squad Car Toughbooks

November 20, 2017

ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION COST PER TOTAL COST COST PER TOTAL COST COST PER TOTAL COST

1 6 STYLISTIC Q736, CORE i7-6600U, 

vPro, 8GB, 13.3FHD 

AG,TOUCH&PEN, 128GB SSD SED, 

WWAN, INTEL(ABGN)WLAN, BT, 

NO NFC, CAM, TPM(2.0), STSHELL, 

FP, 19V/65W(3-Pin), WIN10PRO(64-

BIT), 1 YEAR, ES, WIN10PRO(64-

BIT) REC (BQJAD10000PAABMM)

$1,899.00 $11,394.00 $2,108.52 $12,651.12 $2,150.07 $12,900.42

2 6 FUJITSU MOBILITY - ADP 

WARRANTY - 3 YEARS

$221.96 $1,331.76 no bid bundled with 

item 1

$0.00

3 6 FUJITSU PROTECTIVE TPU COVER 

W/ HANDSTRAP (Q736 OR Q775)

$87.98 $527.88 no bid bundled with 

item 1

$0.00

4 6 ELEGANT X-HANDLE FOR Q736 

TPU CASE

$118.94 $713.64 no bid bundled with 

item 1

$0.00

5 1 ONE PERFORMANCE DOCKING 

CRADLE (FPCPR294AQ)

$142.31 $142.31 no bid no charge $0.00

6 1 2017 CHEVY TAHOE DASH MOUNT 

AS SPECIFIED 

no bid no bid $1,407.69 $1,407.69

7 2 2009 CROWN VICTORIA DASH 

MOUNT AS SPECIFIED

no bid no bid $1,428.21 $2,856.42

8 1 2015 FPI RETAIL DASH MOUNT AS 

SPECIFIED

no bid no bid $1,235.70 $1,235.70

9 1 FPI U INTERCEPTOR DASH 

MOUNT AS SPECIFIED

no bid no bid $1,383.33 $1,383.33

10 1 FPI S INTERCEPTOR DASH MOUNT 

AS SPECIFIED

no bid no bid $1,220.51 $1,220.51

11 6 INSTALLATION SERVICES no bid no bid $400.00 $2,400.00

TOTAL $14,109.59 $12,651.12 $23,404.07
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