Joliet Junior College
Bid for Microscopes
January 8, 2010 at 11:00a.m.
Nikon Instruments Olympus W. Nuhsbaum, Inc. Fisher Scientific Fisher Scientific Alternate Benz Microscope Optic Center Nikon Instruments Southland Instruments Labsco
ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY COST/Ea. TOTAL COST| COST/Ea. TOTAL COST, COST/Ea. TOTAL COST, COST/Ea. TOTAL COST| COST/Ea. TOTAL COST COST/Ea. TOTAL COST| COST/Ea. TOTAL COST COST/Ea. TOTAL COST COST/Ea. TOTAL COST|
Olympus CX31-045 or equivalent $1,116.43 $27,910.75 $1,145.25 $28,631.25 $903.55 $22,588.75 $842.00 $21,918.00 $1,265.29 $32,897.54 $951.00 $23,750.00 $968.32 $25,176.32 $577.00 $14,425.00 $1,119.92 $27,998.00
1 per specifications 25
each * 26 each *26 each *26 each
Olympus CX31-105 or equivalent $1,309.71 $1,309.71 $1,473.00 $1,473.00 $1,004.09 $1,004.09 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 $1,016.00 $1,016.00 Included $0.00 $998.00 $998.00| $2,101.45 $2,101.45
2 per specifications 1
each
Included $0.00 $7.50 $195.00 included $0.00| included $0.00 included $0.00 included $0.00 Included $0.00 included $0.00 included $0.00
3 Dust cover hood per specifications 26
each
Included $0.00 $2.25 $58.50 included $0.00 $22.37 $581.62 $22.37 $581.62 included $0.00 Included $0.00 $2.00 $52.00 $5.60 $145.60
4 Pointer B0681 per specifications 26
each
20.4MM Diameter Micrometer Included $0.00 $41.25 $1,072.50 $52.26 $1,358.76 $25.97 $675.82 $89.17 $2,318.42 $75.00 $1,875.00 Included $0.00 $75.00 $1,950.00 $53.55 $1,392.30
5 Disc per specifications 26
each
Included $0.00 $19.55 $508.30 included $0.00| included $0.00 included $0.00 included $0.00 Included $0.00 N/C $0.00 included $0.00
Retaining Ring for WHK-10X Item
6 #2-8a0502 per specifications 26
each
Power Cord Holder C-0900 per Included $0.00 $14.25 $370.50 included $0.00| included $0.00 included $0.00 included $0.00 Included $0.00 Included $0.00 $12.00 $312.00
7 specifications 26
each
Included $0.00 $4.58 $119.08 included $0.00| included $0.00 included $0.00 included $0.00 Included $0.00 Included $0.00 included $0.00
3 Thumb Screw for CX Observation
Tube Item #AA825600 or
equivalent per specifications 26
each
9 On-site installation 26 Included $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 included $0.00 no bid no bid not included $0.00 Included $0.00 *$1000 $1,000.00 no charge $0.00
each
10 In-Service Training 26 Included $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 included $0.00 no bid no bid not included $0.00 Included $0.00 *$1000 $1,000.00 no charge $0.00
each
Both *$150.00 $150.00
completed Shipping
at same
Additional Information time
TOTALS $29,220.46 $32,428.13 $24,951.60 $23,175.44 $35,797.58 $26,641.00 $25,176.32 $19,425.00 $32,099.35
Certification of Bidder X X X X X X X X X
Addendum Acknowledged X X X X X X
Manufacturer Nikon Instruments, Inc Olympus CX31-045/ CX31-105 Leica Fisher Scientific Carl Zeiss Labo Med Nikon Labo Med Nikon
Model E200 Basic Set R DM500 Micro Master Primo Star 9126001P modified 9126003P E100 SET 9126001-100 E200
Warranty 5 year Mechanical 5 year Mechanical or optical $5.0000
1 year Electrical 1 year Electrical 5 year 2 year electrical, optical or 2 year electrical, optical or 5 year 5 year mechanical/ 1 year electrical |5 year 1 year electrical/ 5 year
Parts mechanical part/labor mechanical part/labor optical/mechanical - Warranty does
Labor 2 year 5 year 5 year
No Bid:
Cynmar Corp

Frey Scientific




