
Joliet Junior College

Bid for Student Handbook

January 30, 2012 @ 2:00pm

QNTY

13,000

* *

148 pages $18,189.00 $13,207.00 no bid $14,709.00 $20,950.00 $21,566.00 $21,823.00 $14,248.00 $18,918.90 $13,786.00 $15,025.28

152 pages $19,266.00 $14,236.00 $14,552.00 $14,932.00 $21,075.00 $21,886.00 $21,043.00 $14,623.00 $13,797.00 $16,592.70

156 pages $19,266.00 $14,236.00 no bid $15,189.00 $21,150.00 $22,206.00 $22,115.00 $14,998.00 $14,367.00 $16,737.51

160 pages $18,909.00 $14,198.00 $15,770.00 $15,255.00 $21,225.00 $22,996.00 $21,335.00 $15,373.00 $19,899.88 $13,765.00 $16,590.66

ADD FOR EA ADD'L 4 PAGES

13000 over 160 pages $1,219.00 $237.00 $300.00 $320.00 $292.00 $322.40 $420.00

DEDUCT FOR EA FEWER 4 PAGES

13000 under 148 pages $854.00 $237.00 -$100.00 -$320.00 $234.00 -$320.00 $18,918.90 $435.00

QNTY

15,000

* *

148 pages $20,351.00 $14,870.00 no bid $16,722.00 $23,600.00 $24,854.00 $23,913.00 $15,960.00 $21,021.00 $15,302.00 $17,132.69

152 pages $21,555.00 $16,031.00 $16,248.00 $16,977.00 $23,725.00 $25,535.00 $23,043.00 $16,393.00 $15,323.00 $18,934.80

156 pages $21,555.00 $16,031.00 no bid $17,270.00 $23,800.00 $26,216.00 $24,219.00 $16,826.00 $15,968.00 $19,123.78

160 pages $21,170.00 $15,999.00 $17,640.00 $17,343.00 $23,875.00 $27,006.00 $23,349.00 $17,259.00 $21,991.20 $15,343.00 $18,924.25

ADD FOR EA ADD'L 4 PAGES

15000 over 160 pages $1,396.00 $266.00 $350.00 $680.00 $306.00 $372.00 $436.00

DEDUCT FOR EA FEWER 4 PAGES

15000 under 148 pages $978.00 $266.00 -$125.00 -$680.00 $245.00 -$368.00 $21,021.00 $446.00

QNTY

16,000 * *

148 pages $21,434.00 $15,701.00 no bid $17,786.00 $24,950.00 $26,168.00 $26,002.00 $16,816.00 $22,422.40 $16,081.00 $18,152.58

152 pages $22,702.00 $16,929.00 $17,072.00 $18,053.00 $25,075.00 $26,968.00 $25,042.00 $17,277.00 $16,110.00 $20,070.54

156 pages $22,702.00 $16,929.00 no bid $18,363.00 $25,150.00 $27,768.00 $26,322.00 $17,738.00 $16,732.00 $20,282.38

160 pages $22,301.00 $16,898.00 $18,549.00 $18,439.00 $25,225.00 $28,009.00 $25,362.00 $18,199.00 $23,457.28 $16,101.00 $20,099.83

ADD FOR EA ADD'L 4 PAGES

16000 over 160 pages $1,484.00 $281.00 $400.00 $800.00 $320.00 $396.00 $459.00

DEDUCT FOR EA FEWER 4 PAGES

16000 under 148 pages $1,039.00 $281.00 -$150.00 -$800.00 $256.00 -$394.00 $22,422.40 $469.00

Option 1: (148 pages) per thousand beyond 16,000 $1,081.34 $831.33 no bid $1,065.00 $1,400.00 $1,120.00 $2,089.00 $1,045.00 $885.00 $1,043.00

Option 2: (152 pages) per thousand beyond 16,000 $1,145.05 $898.02 $1,006.00 $1,078.00 $1,350.00 $1,218.00 $1,999.00 $1,070.00 $894.00 $1,163.00

Option 3: (156 pages) per thousand beyond 16,000 $1,145.05 $898.02 no bid $1,110.00 $1,350.00 $1,320.00 $2,103.00 $1,100.00 $917.00 $1,174.00

Option 4: (160 pages) per thousand beyond 16,000 $1,130.02 $900.23 $1,085.00 $1,124.00 $1,350.00 $1,400.00 $2,013.00 $1,130.00 $897.00 $1,168.00

Additional Costs *$660.50 - shipping 

costs for all 

counts/page options

*$660.50 - 

shipping costs for 

all counts/page 

options

over/under will 

depend on final 

page count

Certification of Bidder YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Cover Paper is FSC or PCW YES YES YES NO YES YES - Kallima cover YES YES

Inside Paper must be FSC or PCW Finch casa Vellum 

Opaque 70#

70# HUSRY BY 

DOMTAR - FSC

WAUSAU EXACT 

OFFSET TEXT

Paperfect FSC Paperfect - body 70LB. American 

Eagle

YES - 

WILLIAMSBURG 

70#OFFSET fsc - 

mACpAPER

Wood Free 75 GSM 

Recycled Stock 

PCW 30%

Finch 70# 70# HUSKY 

OFFSET FSC

Additional Comments see attached pricing 

for over/under  (8 

pages not 4 quotes) 

Option 152 and 160 

will have 4 blanks

see attached 

pricing for 

over/under  (8 

pages not 4 

quotes) Option 

152 and 160 will 

have 4 blanks

Call for pricing on 

over 176 pages 

Sample Handbook Included YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Sample Cover Stock YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Sample Offset YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

No Bid

Elan Publishing

School Specialty

RR Donnelley 

(option 1 as 

specified)

RR Donnelley 

(option 2 metal 

coil)

Darby Printing Interstate Creasey Printing 

Services

A & H Lithoprint Data 

Reproductions 

Corp. 

Pride United GraphicsSchool Datebook Action Printing


