Joliet Junior College
Bid for Football Supplies
May 3, 2011 @ 2:00pm
Eich's Sports Home Team Athletics Hayden's Atheletic Riddell Pyramid School Products BSN Sports Neff Motivation Rogers Athletic Santo Sport Store
ITEM QUANTITY |DESCRIPTION each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost
1 5 Wilson GST Footballs $26.00 $130.00 $83.95 $419.75 $56.00 $280.00 no bid $64.79 $323.95 $52.70 $263.50
each No Substitutions
Wilson Wilson ncaa Wilson Wilson
WTF1780 1003 GST 1003B
WTF 1003B
2 200 Black Mouthpieces $0.40 $80.00 $0.45 $90.00 $0.45 $90.00 $0.38 $76.00 6.50 pgk of 25 $52.00
each
Manufacturer/Model: Safetguard Adams Adams Riddell Adams
SS11k MG2 MA301
3 120 Black Pro Style Game $4.00 $480.00 $3.10 $372.00 $4.50 $540.00 $3.55 $426.00 $3.05 $366.00 $1.88 $225.60
Socks
pair
Manufacturer/Model: Profelt Pro feet Twin City Riddell Bristol Twin City
306 112
4 120 White Pro Style Game $4.00 $480.00 $3.10 $372.00 $4.50 $540.00 3.55 $426.00 $3.05 $366.00 $1.88 $225.60
Socks
pair
Manufacturer/Model: Profelt Pro feet Twin City Bristol Twin City
306 112
5 McDavid Hex Pad
Integrated Girdle
No Substitutions Riddell
5 Small $0.00 $42.95 $214.75 $24.50 $122.50 $18.90 $94.50
5 Medium $0.00 $42.95 $214.75 $24.50 $122.50 $18.90 $94.50
10 Large $0.00 $42.95 $429.50 $24.50 $245.00 $18.90 $189.00
5 XLarge $0.00 $42.95 $214.75 $24.50 $122.50 $18.90 $94.50
10 3XLarge $0.00 $53.95 $539.50 $28.00 $280.00 $18.90 $189.00
6 100 Sportstars Helmet $0.00 $9.25 $925.00 $4.00 $400.00 $0.00 $0.00 2.27 $227.00
Decals,full color left/right
facing
pair Neff
No Substitutions DE100
7 150 feet |white decal 8.5 $144.50 3 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00 9.19 $36.76
per sheet Neff DE500|
Sportstars Single
helmet strips helmet tape
(6 per sheet) sold 25 per
=17 pack strips
are 20"long
each
8 50 Black Game Belts $1.50 $75.00 $4.25 $212.50 $1.00 $50.00 $3.98 $199.00 $0.85 $42.50 $0.68 $34.00 $1.33 $66.50
ea
Manufacturer/Model: Champro Adams Adams Riddell Champion Adams Athletic Spec
FWB1 $520.00 510 PfWB
9 350 1/2" steel tip cleats 16.00 pack of $64.00 $0.16 $56.00 $0.15 $52.50 $0.14 $49.00 $0.14 $52.50
100
ea
Manufacturer/Model: NPB 926 Adams Athl Spec Riddell Athletic Spec
FC1 NPB 1/2"
10 150 3/4” steel tip cleats $0.00 $0.22 $33.00 $0.15 $22.50 no bid
ea
Manufacturer/Model: Adams
FC4 (durable 3/4" does not
hard come in steel
polyurethane tip bidding
3/4" poly
11 Russell Adult mesh no bid
football practice jerseys
No Substitutions
5 Large $0.00 18.25 $91.25 14 $70.00
5 Xlarge $0.00 18.25 $91.25 14 $70.00
12 Russell White game $0.00 no bid
pants




Joliet Junior College
Bid for Football Supplies
May 3, 2011 @ 2:00pm
Eich's Sports Home Team Athletics Hayden's Atheletic Rid Pyramid School Products BSN Sports Neff Motivation Rogers Athletic Santo Sport Store
ITEM QUANTITY |DESCRIPTION each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost each cost total cost
ea
No Substitutions
5 small $0.00 38.15 $190.75 28 $140.00
5 medium $0.00 38.15 $190.75 28 $140.00
5 large $0.00 38.15 $190.75 28 $140.00
5 XL $0.00 38.15 $190.75 28 $140.00
13 40 Wristband coaching 8.75 $350.00 7.92 $316.80 7.95 $318.00 6.7 $268.00 5.98 $239.20 $6.84 $273.60
sleeves
Manufacturer/Model: Adams WCSI Adams #wcl Riddell Adams/Neam
ann
14 1 Lineman split marker $0.00 $65.10 $65.10 $98.00 $98.00 $118.75 $118.75 69.98 $69.98 169.00 169.00
ea
Manufacturer/Model: Adams Riddell Pro down Rogers
#ADA39
15 1 Running Ropes/agility $26.00 $26.00 $65.00 $65.00 $56.00 $56.00 $158.21 $158.21 129.98 $129.98 $385.00 $385.00
trainer
ea
Manufacturer/Model: Champro Champion Riddell Pro down Rogers
A820 #AGL deluxe
speed agility
ladder
30Ix20W
16 20 Shoulder pad foam $0.00 $19.33 $386.60 $13.50 $270.00 $18.33 $366.60 $10.91 $218.20 $10.73 $214.60
cushion adult size
ea
Manufacturer/Model: Adams #29 1/2" thick
1/2 " thick Large
Addendum Acknowledged X X X X X X
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