Joliet Junior College

Quote for Xerographic Paper

January 27, 2011 @9:00am

Unisource Murnane Midland Paper Midland Paper option B Premier Paper Group Quill Source One
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION COST PER | TOTAL COST Recycled| COST PER | TOTAL COST| Recycled COST PER TOTAL Recycled COST PER | TOTAL COST| Recycled COST PER TOTAL Recycled COST PER |TOTAL COST| Recycled COST PER TOTAL Recycled
1 200 BLUE PAPER 8 %2 X 11 WAUSAU $3.54 $708.00 30% $3.387 $677.40 30% $3.6500 $730.00 30% $3.500 $700.00 0.00% $4.30 $860.00 0% no bid $0.00 $4.99 $998.00 30%
BRAND
STOCK #32521
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(JJC STOCK #490)
Reams
2 240 GREEN PAPER 8 %2 X 11 WAUSAU $3.54 $849.60 30% $3.387 $812.88 30% $3.6500 $876.00 30% $3.50 $840.00 0.00% $4.30 $1,032.00 0% no bid $0.00 $4.99 $1,197.60 30%
BRAND
STOCK #32561
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(JJC STOCK #494)
Reams
3 200 CANARY PAPER 8 %2 X 11 $3.54 $708.00 30% $3.387 $677.40 30% $3.6500 $730.00 30% $3.50 $700.00 0.00% $4.30 $860.00 0% no bid $0.00 $4.99 $998.00 30%
WAUSAU BRAND
STOCK #32541
NO SUBSTITUTIONS
(JJC STOCK #492)
reams
4 40 WHITE PAPER 8 %2 X 14 $4.15 $166.00 0% $3.890 $155.60 0% $3.900 $156.00 0% $3.90 $156.00 0.00% $10.85 $434.00 0% $4.61 $184.40 $5.20 $207.96 0%
(JJC STOCK #498)
Reams
Brand Name/Description comet 92 bright Prestige 20 95 brightness Prestie 30# 95 brightness 98 bright image print Quil Bid 720223
5 100 LASER PAPER, WHITE 8 1/2" X $5.58 $558.00 0% $5.590 $559.00 0% $5.800 $580.00 50% $4.50 $450.00 0.00% $4.95 $495.00 0% no bid $0.00 $7.999 $799.90 0%
11", WEYERHAUSER #8576, 96
BRIGHTNESS (NO
SUBSTITUTIONS) JJC stock #510
Reams
TOTAL $2,989.60 $2,882.28 $3,072.00 $2,846.00 $3,681.00 $184.40 $4,201.46
Special Notes: Must award all or none between our option A |Alternate Brand: Multipurpose;Additional 1%
& B /Additional 1% discount paid in 30 days. |discount if paid in 30 days/Must award all or
none between our option A & B
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