
Joliet Junior College
Bid for Custodial Equipment
June 2, 2011 @ 10:00am

ITEM UNTIE DESCRIPTION UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
1 5

WINVSP14 Windsor Versamatic 
plus 14” dual motor vacuum, NO 
SUBSTITUTION

no bid $0.00 $545.00 $2,725.00

each
Warranty Manufacturer attached

2 3 TEN9007629 Nobles EX-spot 2-kit 
2 gallon carpet spotter w/8ft 
hose and hand tool, kit includes a 
portable cart, chemical kit 
w/products, reference chart, 
procedure guide, scraper and 
tamping brush, NO 
SUBSTITUTION

$501.00 $1,503.00 $549.90 $1,649.70

each

Warranty
1 year parts 

& labor

3 1 TEN9007469-15 Gal Wet/Dry 
Vacuum, included 10ft. hose & 
wand, cloth and paper bag NO 
SUBSTITUTION

$412.00 $412.00 $422.13 $422.13

each

Warranty
2 year parts  

& labor
Manufacturer attached

4 1 TEN190108-26” front mount 
squeegee kit for Wet/Dry vac, 
NO SUBSTITUTION

$219.00 $219.00 $247.77 $247.77

each
Warranty   parts & labor Manufacturer attached

5 2
Advance Advenger Model #2805 
D, w/ecoflex ride on automatic 
scrubber NO SUBSTITUTION

no bid $0.00 $11,224.79 $22,449.58

each
Warranty Manufacturer attached

6 2 Advance Adfinity X20R Rev Walk 
Behind Floor Scrubber NO 
SUBSTITUTION

no bid $0.00 $5,295.00 $10,590.00

each
Warranty Manufacturer attached

7 1
Advance Advolution, Model 
#20B+ Battery Burnisher w/ dust 
control, NO SUBSTITUTION

no bid $0.00 $5,140.14 $5,140.14

each
Warranty Manufacturer attached

8 1 Advance ES4000, battery 
powered riding 
extractor/vacuum dual 
mode/extractor vacuum only NO 
SUBSTITUTION

no bid $0.00 $10,800.00 $10,800.00

each
Warranty Manufacturer attached

Certification  Of Contract Bidder X X

Tri K Supplies AmSan

Manufacturer attached
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