
Joliet Junior College
Bid for Custodial Supplies
June 02, 2011 @ 10:30 AM

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
JJC 11 JOHNSON WAX 

PROFESSIONAL 
SPITFIRE RTU POWER 
CLEANER; (12 
QUARTS/CASE); NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS

20 Case(s) no bid no bid $0.00 $0.00 $47.88 $957.66 no bid no bid $35.95 $719.00 no bid

JJC 14 BIO DEGRADE AWAY 
BAGS #DA 39XH 
DEGRADABLE BAG 
33"X39" HI/LO BLEND 
100/CS 1.5 SHIP 50 
CASES UPON RECEIPT 
OF PO AND 
REMAINING CASES 
TO BE SHIPPED 
IF/WHEN NEEDED 
UPON CALL

400 Case(s) no bid $15.36 $6,144.00 $12.99 $5,196.00 $14.60 no bid no bid $12.80 $5,120.00 $12.99 $5,196.00 no bid

Alternate Colonial Bag
JJC 15 BIO DEGRADE AWAY 

BAGS #DA 58XH 
DEGRADABLE BAG, 
38"X58" HI/LO BLEND 
100/CS. NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS 
DROP SHIP 50 CASES 
UPON RECEIPT OF 
PO, REMAINING TO 
BE SHIPPED IF/WHEN 
NEEDED UPON CALL

400 Case(s) no bid $26.31 $10,524.00 $20.75 $8,300.00 $23.75 no bid no bid $18.71 $7,484.00 $20.60 $8,240.00 no bid

Alternate Colonial Bag
JJC 20 SPARTAN SD-20 ALL 

PURPOSE SPRAY 
DEGREASER (12 
CANS/CASE)--NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS

20 Case(s) no bid no bid no bid no bid $26.10 $522.00 $31.95 $639.00 no bid

JJC 35 KRYSTAL PREMIUM 
TOILET SEAT COVERS, 
(250 PER PACK, 10 
PACKS PER CASE) NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS

20 CS no bid $20.39 $407.80 $0.00 $37.20 $21.23 $424.60 $29.00 $580.00 $19.00 $380.00 24.95 pack 
of 250/ 
case of 10 
packs

$499.00 $20.52 $410.40

Reno 3800

Tri-K AmSan AztecVegaLippert Performance Chemical Valdes Seaway Supply Unlimited Graphix



Joliet Junior College
Bid for Custodial Supplies
June 02, 2011 @ 10:30 AM

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Tri-K AmSan AztecVegaLippert Performance Chemical Valdes Seaway Supply Unlimited Graphix

JJC 37 Rubbermaid 
6373,100% corn fill 
corn brooms, no subs

40 CS $37.48 $1,499.20 58.95 case 
of 12

$2,358.00 3.65 each $40.26 5.65 each $49.26 $1,970.40 105.00 /12 
case

$4,200.00 $42.00 $1,680.00 30.60 case 
of 12

$918.00 $49.09 $1,963.60

JJC 38 Rubbermaid 2531, 
Lobby Pro Upright 
Dust pan, no subs

30 CS $76.63 $2,298.90 85.75 case 
of 6

$2,572.50 12.95 each $388.50 18.60 each 100.98 case 
of 6

$3,029.40 $14.00 $420.00 $83.00 $2,490.00 62.28 case 
of 6

$1,868.40 $95.83 $2,874.90

JJC 39 Rubbermaid 3154-88 
Deluxe carry caddy, 
no subs

50 CS $51.97 $2,598.50 53.53 case 
of 6

$2,676.50 46.99 case $2,395.22 13.44 each 10.95 each $547.80 63.00 case of 
6

$3,150.00 $8.60 $430.00 42.42 case 
of 6

$2,121.00 $59.76 $2,988.00

JJC 40 Rubbermaid H246 
Gripper clamp style 
Fiberglass handles 
w/plastic yellow 60” 
head, no subs

20 CS $154.74 $3,094.80 142.70 case 
of 12

$2,854.00 123.99 case $2,479.80 16.68 each 163.54 case       $3,270.80 171.00 case 
of 12

$3,420.00 $137.00 $2,740.00 128.28 case 
of 12

$2,565.60 $159.36 $3,187.20

JJC 41 Rubbermaid H245 
Gripper clamp style 
Fiberglass handles 
w/plastic yellow 54” 
head, no subs

20 CS $158.85 $3,177.00 138.56 case  $2,771.20 18.84 each 12.91 each $258.28 $150.00 $3,000.00 $136.00 $2,720.00 131.64 case 
of 12

$2,632.80 $154.80 $3,096.00

JJC 42 SPA4050-05 Spartan 
White Sunflower 
Floor Finish, no subs

10 PAIL no bid no bid no bid no bid $34.00 $340.00 $59.95 $599.50 no bid

JJC 43 SPA3305 Lite ‘N 
Foamy Sunflower 
Fresh Hand Soap, no 
subs

10 CS no bid no bid no bid no bid $34.00 $340.00 $49.12 $491.20 no bid

JJC 44 GP Forward General 
Purpose Cleaner, no 
subs

10 PAIL no bid no bid no bid $40.00 $400.00 $37.95 $379.50 no bid

JJC 45 Heavy Duty #4 Ply 
Blended yarn, looped 
end/banded 1# 
headband 24oz mop. 
(12 per case) must 
provide sample.

20 CS no bid 69.78 case 
of 12

$1,395.60 74.85 case 
of 12

$1,497.10 38.00 case of 
12 

$760.00 no bid $61.20 $1,224.00 38.33 12 
case

$766.60

Greenwood ABCO



Joliet Junior College
Bid for Custodial Supplies
June 02, 2011 @ 10:30 AM

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Tri-K AmSan AztecVegaLippert Performance Chemical Valdes Seaway Supply Unlimited Graphix

JJC 46 Spartan SPA4830 Tri 
Base Bio bases green 
Seal multi purpose 
floor cleaner.  With 5 
each -clean on the go 
stainless steel lock & 
dial chemical 4 
button dispenser (no 
charge) included 
from awarded bidder 
of Spartan chemicals, 
no subs.

50 CS no bid no bid no bid no bid $33.60 $1,680.00 $40.25 $2,012.50 no bid

JJC 47 Spartan SPA4835 
Glass cleaner Bio 
based green seal 
glass cleaner, no subs

35 CS no bid no bid no bid no bid $37.90 $1,326.50 $44.50 $1,557.50 no bid

JJC 48 Spartan SPA4820 
Clean by Peroxy 
Green Seal all 
purpose peroxide 
based cleaner, no 
subs

35 CS no bid no bid no bid no bid $48.70 $1,704.50 $57.10 $1,998.50 no bid

JJC 49 Spartan HDQ C2 
Neutral Hospital 
Grade disinfectant 
cleaner, no subs

35 CS no bid no bid no bid no bid $29.10 $1,018.50 $34.90 $1,221.50 no bid

JJC 50 Spartan Peroxy 
protein cleaner for 
food service 
applications, no subs

35 CS no bid no bid no bid no bid $49.00 $1,715.00 $47.20 $1,652.00 no bid

JJC 51 Rubbermaid 
RCP295573BL 13 
quart deskside 
recycling container 
“blue”, no subs

108 EA $4.74 $511.92 $4.09 $441.72 $3.99 $430.92 $10.50 $4.71 $509.65 $5.30 $572.40 $4.00 $432.00 $3.99 $430.92 $4.04 $436.32

JJC 52 Rubbermaid 
RCP295673BL 28 
Quart deskside 
recycling container 
“blue”, no subs

108 EA $5.22 $563.76 $4.48 $483.84 $4.25 $459.00 $5.40 $5.10 $550.80 $5.30 $572.40 $4.50 $486.00 $4.26 $460.08 $4.34 $468.72



Joliet Junior College
Bid for Custodial Supplies
June 02, 2011 @ 10:30 AM

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Tri-K AmSan AztecVegaLippert Performance Chemical Valdes Seaway Supply Unlimited Graphix

JJC 53 Rubbermaid 
RCP295200BG 8 
quart waste basket 
“beige”, no subs

108 EA $5.15 $556.20 $4.29 $463.32 $4.25 $459.00 $6.60 $5.10 $550.80 $5.25 $567.00 $4.30 $464.40 $4.20 $453.60 $4.36 $470.88

JJC 54 Rubbermaid RCP1305-
73BL Recycling Tilt 
Truck “blue”, no subs

6 EA $588.67 $3,532.02 $531.33 $3,187.98 $511.00 $3,066.00 $678.00 $613.80 $3,682.80 $515.00 $3,090.00 $500.00 $3,000.00 $460.99 $2,765.94 $533.98 $3,203.88

JJC 55 Rubbermaid 
RCP9T7200BK High 
Capacity Cleaning 
Cart, no subs

6 EA $235.20 $1,411.20 $190.00 $1,140.00 $183.99 $1,103.94 $274.80 $217.72 $1,303.32 $210.00 $1,260.00 $182.00 $1,092.00 $189.99 $1,139.94 $192.00 $1,152.00

JJC 56 Rubbermaid 
RCP757788YL 35QT 
Wavebreak Yellow 
Mop bucket w/down 
press wringer, no 
subs

6 EA $76.80 $460.80 $86.20 $517.20 $83.99 $503.94 $129.00 $100.36 $602.18 $80.00 $480.00 $82.00 $492.00 $59.99 $359.94 $87.72 $526.32

JJC 57 Rubbermaid 
RCP9T7400RD Dirty 
Water bucket for 
wavebreak mop 
bucket, no subs

5 EA $18.34 $91.70 $14.00 $70.00 $229.99 $1,149.95 $16.52 $82.61 $275.00 $1,375.00 $300.00 $600.00 $16.99 $84.95 $16.79 $83.95

JJC 58 Rubbermaid 
RCP265500DGR 55 
Gal Brute container 
“green”, no subs

6 EA $65.45 $392.70 $59.00 $354.00 $79.20 65.63 /gray/   $396.82 $63.00 $378.00 $56.00 $336.00 $54.29 $325.74 no bid

Certification of Contract Bidder
Samples
 

Yes Yes Yes NoYes Yes Yes Yes Yes



Joliet Junior College
Bid for Custodial Supplies
June 02, 2011 @ 10:30 AM

ITEM DESCRIPTION
JJC 11 JOHNSON WAX 

PROFESSIONAL 
SPITFIRE RTU POWER 
CLEANER; (12 
QUARTS/CASE); NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS

JJC 14 BIO DEGRADE AWAY 
BAGS #DA 39XH 
DEGRADABLE BAG 
33"X39" HI/LO BLEND 
100/CS 1.5 SHIP 50 
CASES UPON RECEIPT 
OF PO AND 
REMAINING CASES 
TO BE SHIPPED 
IF/WHEN NEEDED 
UPON CALL

Alternate
JJC 15 BIO DEGRADE AWAY 

BAGS #DA 58XH 
DEGRADABLE BAG, 
38"X58" HI/LO BLEND 
100/CS. NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS 
DROP SHIP 50 CASES 
UPON RECEIPT OF 
PO, REMAINING TO 
BE SHIPPED IF/WHEN 
NEEDED UPON CALL

Alternate
JJC 20 SPARTAN SD-20 ALL 

PURPOSE SPRAY 
DEGREASER (12 
CANS/CASE)--NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS

JJC 35 KRYSTAL PREMIUM 
TOILET SEAT COVERS, 
(250 PER PACK, 10 
PACKS PER CASE) NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
$35.08 $701.60

$11.75 $4,700.00 $13.91 $5,560.00 $14.60 $5,840.00 $13.00 $5,200.00 $12.48 $4,992.00 $10.24 $4,096.00 $7.98 $3,192.00 $6.82 $2,728.00 $6.32 $2,528.00

All American Poly $0.00 Central Poly Int 3339 Super exh Int 3339 exh Int 3339 xh INT 3339 hvy INT 3340 Hvy
$25.62 $10,248.00 $22.70 $9,080.00 $23.76 $9,504.00 $17.10 $6,840.00 $20.32 $8,128.00 $16.22 $6,488.00 $13.84 $5,536.00 $11.48 $4,592.00 $9.34 $3,736.00

All American Poly $0.00 Central Poly Int 3339 super exh Int 3858 exh Int 3858 xh Int 3858 hvy Int 3860H
$34.10 $682.00

$0.00 $20.40 $408.00 $23.03 $460.60

Interboro Bid C Interboro Bid D Interboro ERunge Paper Standard Central Poly Sam Tell Interboro A Interboro Bid BAll American Poly



Joliet Junior College
Bid for Custodial Supplies
June 02, 2011 @ 10:30 AM

ITEM DESCRIPTION
   

 
   

  
  

JJC 37 Rubbermaid 
6373,100% corn fill 
corn brooms, no subs

JJC 38 Rubbermaid 2531, 
Lobby Pro Upright 
Dust pan, no subs

JJC 39 Rubbermaid 3154-88 
Deluxe carry caddy, 
no subs

JJC 40 Rubbermaid H246 
Gripper clamp style 
Fiberglass handles 
w/plastic yellow 60” 
head, no subs

JJC 41 Rubbermaid H245 
Gripper clamp style 
Fiberglass handles 
w/plastic yellow 54” 
head, no subs

JJC 42 SPA4050-05 Spartan 
White Sunflower 
Floor Finish, no subs

JJC 43 SPA3305 Lite ‘N 
Foamy Sunflower 
Fresh Hand Soap, no 
subs

JJC 44 GP Forward General 
Purpose Cleaner, no 
subs

JJC 45 Heavy Duty #4 Ply 
Blended yarn, looped 
end/banded 1# 
headband 24oz mop. 
(12 per case) must 
provide sample.

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Interboro Bid C Interboro Bid D Interboro ERunge Paper Standard Central Poly Sam Tell Interboro A Interboro Bid BAll American Poly

$3.90 $156.00 $31.99 $1,279.60 $55.20 $2,208.00

$14.30 $429.00 $65.15 $1,954.50 $93.48 $2,804.40

$8.95 $447.50 $44.40 $2,220.00 $55.20 $2,760.00

$12.59 $251.80 $134.16 $2,683.20 $169.92 $3,398.40

$12.25 $245.00 $137.75 $2,755.00 $165.72 $3,314.40

$70.00 $700.00

$50.00 $500.00

$0.00 $35.35 $353.50

34.27 / 6 
case 

$1,370.80



Joliet Junior College
Bid for Custodial Supplies
June 02, 2011 @ 10:30 AM

ITEM DESCRIPTION
   

 
   

  
  

JJC 46 Spartan SPA4830 Tri 
Base Bio bases green 
Seal multi purpose 
floor cleaner.  With 5 
each -clean on the go 
stainless steel lock & 
dial chemical 4 
button dispenser (no 
charge) included 
from awarded bidder 
of Spartan chemicals, 
no subs.

JJC 47 Spartan SPA4835 
Glass cleaner Bio 
based green seal 
glass cleaner, no subs

JJC 48 Spartan SPA4820 
Clean by Peroxy 
Green Seal all 
purpose peroxide 
based cleaner, no 
subs

JJC 49 Spartan HDQ C2 
Neutral Hospital 
Grade disinfectant 
cleaner, no subs

JJC 50 Spartan Peroxy 
protein cleaner for 
food service 
applications, no subs

JJC 51 Rubbermaid 
RCP295573BL 13 
quart deskside 
recycling container 
“blue”, no subs

JJC 52 Rubbermaid 
RCP295673BL 28 
Quart deskside 
recycling container 
“blue”, no subs

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Interboro Bid C Interboro Bid D Interboro ERunge Paper Standard Central Poly Sam Tell Interboro A Interboro Bid BAll American Poly

$4.24 $457.92 $4.04 $436.32 $6.49 $700.92

$4.50 $486.00 $4.46 $481.68 $6.84 $738.72



Joliet Junior College
Bid for Custodial Supplies
June 02, 2011 @ 10:30 AM

ITEM DESCRIPTION
   

 
   

  
  

JJC 53 Rubbermaid 
RCP295200BG 8 
quart waste basket 
“beige”, no subs

JJC 54 Rubbermaid RCP1305-
73BL Recycling Tilt 
Truck “blue”, no subs

JJC 55 Rubbermaid 
RCP9T7200BK High 
Capacity Cleaning 
Cart, no subs

JJC 56 Rubbermaid 
RCP757788YL 35QT 
Wavebreak Yellow 
Mop bucket w/down 
press wringer, no 
subs

JJC 57 Rubbermaid 
RCP9T7400RD Dirty 
Water bucket for 
wavebreak mop 
bucket, no subs

JJC 58 Rubbermaid 
RCP265500DGR 55 
Gal Brute container 
“green”, no subs

Certification of Contract Bidder
Samples
 

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Interboro Bid C Interboro Bid D Interboro ERunge Paper Standard Central Poly Sam Tell Interboro A Interboro Bid BAll American Poly

$4.57 $494.64 $4.37 $471.96 $4.72 $509.76

$579.00 $3,474.00 $492.23 $2,953.38 $660.80 $3,964.80

$207.00 $1,242.00 $197.63 $1,185.78 $213.58 $1,281.48

$94.50 $567.00 $61.70 $370.20 $112.99 $677.94

$259.80 $1,299.00 $248.19 $1,240.95 $16.28 $81.40

$0.00 $59.50 $357.00 $56.77 $340.62 $0.00 $68.15 $408.84

YesYes YesYes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Yes YesYes Yes Yes Yes Yes YesYesYes
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