
Joliet Junior College

Bid for Design/Layout & Printing JJC 

Magazine Fall 2010

7/21/2010 @ 2:00pm

DESIGN/LAYOUT

Cover plus 28 pages $4,500.00 $5,610.00 $60.00 @ hour $2,720.00 $1,200.00 NO BID $5,940.00 NO BID $4,790.00 NO BID

Cost for additional stock art $0.00 INCLUDED $50.00 @ image $10.00 PER IMAGE $25.00 EACH $75.00 $10.00 per image

Additional costs not included in bid or 

above options

N/A

References YES YES YES NO YES YES YES

PRINTING - 25000 COPIES

Cover plus 28 inside pages $12,896.00 $17,799.00 $12,575.10 $13,230.00 $12,805.00 $15,200.00 $14,575.00 $12,918.54 NO BID $12,018.82

Envelope $1,450.00 $1,994.00 $1,241.36 $1,708.00 $1,875.00 $1,600.00 $750.00 $1,951.68 $1,778.16

JOLIET PO DELIVERY COSTS

Joliet Post Office Deliver Costs $50.00 $400.00 $420.00 $225.00 $250.00 $1,100.00 $150.00 $0.00 $200.00

Delivery per drop to other area post $50.00 $0.00 $0.00 $100.00 $75.00 $100.00 $125.00 N/A $75.00

offices as needed

TOTAL PRINTING COSTS $14,446.00 $20,193.00 $14,236.46 $15,263.00 $15,005.00 $18,000.00 $15,600.00 $14,870.22 $14,071.98

AVERAGE CHARGE PER 

CORRECTION AFTER PROOF

$10.00 $15.00 $25.00 minimum $13.00 per page $25.00 $25.00 $60.00 N/A $15.00

ESTIMATED COST FOR POSTAL 

FEES FOR 24,500MAGAZINES

$1100.00 + postage $7,000.00 $1,246.73 TBD $6,309.07 $8,232.00 .08-.12 N/A .278 TO .38 per piece

References YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

FSC CERTIFIED (Y/N) YES YES NO NO NO YES NO YES NO

Additional Information Please see notes in letter Envelope - 63/4 remittance envelope 

24# white

Will provide sample if 

considered successful 

bidder

Sample work included YES YES YES YES YES NO NO YES YES YES

Sample  paper included YES YES NO YES NO NO NO YES YES

Recycled or Environmental (Y/N) FSC YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Cover Paper used in bid 65# utopia gloss cover 65#  productolith gloss cover 65# white productolith gloss cover Productolith Flo 80# gloss cover 65# sterling ultra gloss FSC Sonoma PCW 65# productolith gloss cover MPC

Inside Paper used in bid Flo gloss text 80# pacsetter gloss FSC 80# white productolith gloss text Productolith Flo 80# gloss text 80# sterling ultra gloss FSC Sonoma PCW 80# productolith gloss text MPC

Certification of Bidder YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

Addendum Acknowledged YES YES YES NO YES NO YES YES YES YES

CASTLE PRIN TECHHAAG PRESSWAYNE PRINTINGSP DIRECTA & H LITHOPRINT ORIGINAL SMITH PRINTING GAMMON GROUP ROCHELLE PRINTING

AMERICAN SOLUTIONS 

FOR BUSINESSNITTANY VALLEY OFFSET


