
Joliet Junior College

Bid for Custodial Supplies

November 22, 2010 @ 2:00pm

ITEM QNTY DESCRIPTION UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

1)

500

JJC#07 - BAY WEST ROLL 

TOWELS; 7-1/2"X800'; 

#714;NATURAL WHITE COLOR; (6 

ROLLS/CASE); SHIP 40 CASES 

UPON RECEIPT OF PO--BALANCE 

DROP SHIP WHEN REQUESTED; 

NO SUBSTITUTION; VENDOR 

MUST FURNISH 50 DISPENSERS 

(Bay West #77510 OptiServe Hybrid 

Hands Free Roll Towel Dispenser 

Black Translucent)AT NO 

ADDITIONAL COST.

$23.00 $11,500.00 $20.83 $10,415.00 no bid $0.00 no bid no bid $48.17 $24,085.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 $35.10 $17,550.00

Case(s) Array/SCA

Alternate Manufacturer NAC HRT classic 800' 6 ct

Alternate Quantity/pkg 800' per rolls, 6 rolls per case

500

JJC#07B - PLEASE PROVIDE THE 

COST OF THE ADDITIONAL 

DISPENSERS AFTER ALLOTTED 

50 FOR JJC#07 HERE; UNIT COST 

ONLY

17.60 $17.60 16.65 $16.65 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 26.50 $26.50

Each

Alternate Manufacturer HRT Array

Alternate Quantity/pkg

2)

500

JJC#12 - JUMBO TOILET TISSUE 2-

PLY; 1000 FEET PER ROLL; (12 

ROLLS/CASE); 9 INCH ROLL; SHIP 

40 CASES UPON RECEIPT OF PO--

BALANCE DROP SHIP WHEN 

REQUESTED; ROLLS WILL BE 

MEASURED TO ENSURE 1000'; 

MUST FIT IN 9" JUMBO BATH 

TISSUE DISPENSER; VENDOR 

MUST FURNISH 40 DISPENSERS 

(EQUAL TO SAN JAMAR 

RENAISSANCE TWIN 9" JUMBO 

BATH TISSUE DISPENSER) AT NO 

ADDITIONAL COST;  **MUST 

PROVIDE SAMPLE**

$27.54 $13,770.00 $24.95 $12,475.00 $23.48 $11,740.00 $31.00 $15,500.00 $22.97 $11,485.00 $17.50 $8,750.00 $19.72 $9,860.00 $23.90 $11,950.00

Alternate Manufacturer NAC HRT Array/ SCA NPS BWK 6100 NTC 102

Alternate Quantity/pkg Jumbo Jr 

1000' per 

roll/12 per 

case

1000' - 12 ct 12 rolls case

3) JJC#12B - PLEASE PROVIDE COST 

OF ADDITIONAL DISPENSERS 

$10.35 $10.35 $21.61 $21.61 $19.50 $19.50 $30.00 $30.00 $21.00 $21.00 $12.20 $12.20 $19.50 $19.50 $22.90 $22.90

Each

Alternate Manufacturer Tore Twin smoke Array NPS #5TT twin sanjamar r4090 twin Update Intl. Sam jamar

Alternate Quantity/pkg 4/case

4)

300

JJC#29 - PRIME SOURCE TOUCH 

FREE LAVENDER FOAM SOAP 

REFILLS, #75004253; 2.-1.2L, 40.5 

FL OZ - 2 PER BOX. VENDOR 

MUST FURNISH 100 DISPENSERS 

AT NO ADDITIONAL COST. NO 

SUBSTITUTIONS.

$0.00 $28.110 $8,433.00 no bid $0.00 $0.00 $39.74 $11,922.00 $0.00 $0.00 No bid $0.00

Case(s)

Alternate Manufacturer Array/GOJO

Alternate Quantity/pkg 2ct/1200ml

20

6) Additional Dispensers $6.65 $6.65 no charge $0.00

5) Case(s) UUC#35 Krystall Premium toilet seat 

covers

$28.46 $569.20 $14.37 $718.50 no bid $0.00 $25.40 $508.00 $17.00 $340.00 $39.17 $391.70 $20.95 $413.99 $28.90 $578.00

Alternate Manufacturer Assure Impact Healthguard Hospital Specialty

Alternate Quantity/pkg 1/2 fold 5000 per case 4-250 ct 250 per 

pack/20 

packs case

pack 5000

Certification of contract bidder

Samples

Yes

Yes Yes

YesYes

YesYes

Yes

No

Yes

No

North American 

Corporation

Gordon Food Service Midland Paper Finkel Supply

Yes

Yes

Yes

No

Yes

Tri-K Supply Standard Lippert PCS Industries


