Joliet Junior College

Bid for Design/Layout & Printing JJC
Magazine Spring 2011

11/18/10 @2:00pm

DESIGN/LAYOUT

Proform Pro MediAspire

Creasey Printing Services

United Graphics, Inc.

Gammon Group

Proforma Lakeshore
Print & Promotions

Castle PrinTech

Rochelle Printing

Original Smith Printing

Cover plus 28 pages $9,000.00 no bid no bid $4,790.00 $4,800.00 $800.00 no bid no bid
Deduction for reduced number of
pages to minimum 16 pages 16pg - $4190.00
(deduction amount per 4 page 20pg - $4390.00
increments) $2,250.00 24pg - $4590.00 $600.00 $25.00 per page
Cost for additional stock art $10.00 each $10.00 per image $10.00 $25.00 each
Additional costs not included in bid or
above options
References Yes Yes Yes
PRINTING - 25000 COPIES
Cover plus 28 inside pages no bid $10,850.00 $17,003.99 no bid $12,801.00 $12,750.00 $11,527.41 $12,616.99
24pg $12184.51
Deduction for 4 page increments to 20pg $11407.08
minimum 16 inside pages -$500.00 -$1,370.47 -$550.00 -$1,450.00 -$1,465.51 16pg $10018.47
Envelope $1,600.00 included $1,352.00 $1,855.00 $1,329.98 $89.61
JOLIET PO DELIVERY COSTS
Joliet Post Office Deliver Costs $200.00 $262.00 $200.00 $250.00 $175.00 NA
Delivery per drop to other area post
offices as needed
$125.00 $86.00 $50.00 $75.00 $0.00 NA
Additional costs not included in bid or addressing/processing
above options $612.50
TOTAL PRINTING COSTS $12,775.00 $17,351.99 $15,015.50 $14,930.00 $13,032.39 $12,706.60
Average charge per correction after $30.00 per page + $6.00 per page at proof stage $60.00 per hour $25.00 $30.00 per page NA
proof $75.00/hour
Estimated postal fees for 24500 .35 each $11,392.50 6.8¢ - 7.7¢ based on jjc $6,309.07 .278 to .38 piece NA
magazines nonprofit permit, higher
postage applies if over
3.3 0z.
References Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
FSC CERTIFIED (Y/N) Yes Yes No No No Yes
Additional Information
Sample work included Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Sample paper included Yes Yes Yes No No Yes
Recycled or Environmental (Y/N) Yes FSC PCW 10% & FSC FSC PCW & FSC
65# gloss sterling or 7 pt
Cover Paper used in bid Flo Gloss 65# productolith gloss fsc certified gloss cover sterling MPC gloss cover Flow Gloss Cover 80# white opus gloss cover
80# shaughness book recycled
Inside Paper used in bid Flo Gloss FSC certified 80# gloss text sterling MPC gloss text Flow Gloss Text 80# white opus gloss text
Certification of Bidder Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes




