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Joliet Junior College
Bid: Culinary Arts Equipment
February 9, 2010 @ 2:00pm

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
1 Display case, refrigerated deli True 

Distribution Model No. TDBD‐48‐2. 
Double duty deli case, see‐thru, 28 
cu. ft., Low‐E glass front & (2) rear 
doors, white aluminum interior 
with coved s/s floor, (1) full 
lengeth s/s/ shelf, (2) PVC coated 
wire shelves, exclusive front & rear 
interior lighting, 1/2 HP, 
115v/60/1, 14.2 amps. Self 
contained refrigeration with 
castors 4" (4) 

1 $3,281.21 $3,281.21 no bid $0.00 $4,681.81 $4,681.81 $3,575.27 $3,575.27 $3,613.99 $3,613.99 $3,487.86 $3,487.86 $3,522.00 $3,522.00 $3,235.00 $3,235.00 $3,250.66 $3,250.66

Each
MANUFACTURER: TRUE TRUE TRUE TRUE TRUE TRUE TRUE
MODEL NUMBER TDBD 48-2 TDBD-48-2 TDBD-48-2 TDBD-48-2 TDBD-48-2 TDBD-48-2 TDBD-48-2
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1
WARRANTY: LABOR 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) No yes yes no

5 year 
compressor

5 year 
compressor

5 year 
compressor

2 Blender, Food Vita‐Mix Model. 
Blender Food 64oz Vita Prep 3

1 $480.32 $480.32 $478.34 $478.34 $659.15 $659.15 $500.47 $500.47 $495.32 $495.32 $486.72 $486.72 no bid $0.00 $550.00 $550.00 $480.32 $480.32

Each
MANUFACTURER: Vita mix vita-mix Vita-mix Vita-mix Vita-mix Vita-mix Vita-mix
MODEL NUMBER 1005 1005 Vita-mix prep 3 1005 1005 H1008 H1005
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 1 1 1 3 3
WARRANTY: LABOR 1 1 1 1 3 3
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

Tri MarkServ-ULippert Inc.Edward Don & CompanyChefs Depot Schweppe Federal Supply USASmith Housewares Stafford-Smith

21
22

23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30

31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38

39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46

47

ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

3 Scale, Portion, Dial Type 
Rubbermaid Commercial Model 
No. 632SRW. Pelouze ® Scale, 
portion, dial type, top loading 
counter model, 30° angled rotating 

12 $66.78 $801.36 $41.26 $495.12 $77.62 $931.44 $66.15 $793.80 $71.15 $853.80 $68.67 $824.04 $76.43 $917.16 $73.35 $880.20 $66.15 $793.80

Each
MANUFACTURER: Rubbermaid Taylor Rubbermaid Pelouze Rubbermaid Pelouze Rubbermaid Rubbermaid
MODEL NUMBER 632SRW B32 632SRW 632srw 6325RW 6325RW 632SRW 632SRW
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year
WARRANTY: LABOR 1 n/a 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no na/ N

4 Saw, meat, Manual Food 
Machinery of America Model 
(11437) Handsaw, 25"

12 $21.29 $255.48 $29.68 $356.16 $52.98 $635.76 $21.40 $256.80 $23.32** $279.84 $28.20 $338.40 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 $22.25 $267.00

Each
MANUFACTURER: Alfa Food Machinery FMA FMA FMA
MODEL NUMBER FMA 6050-25 11437 HS225 HS11437 HS11437
WARRANTY: PARTS H5225 1 year STD See attached 30 days
WARRANTY: LABOR 1 year
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a

5 HSB25 (11441) Handsaw 
Replacement blade, 25"

12 $3.47 $41.64 $3.2500 $39.00 $8.6200 $103.44 $3.49 $41.88 $4.31** $51.72 $5.02 $60.24 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 $3.62 $43.44

Each
MANUFACTURER: FMA Alfa Food Machinery FMA FMA FMA
MODEL NUMBER HSB25 HSB-25 11441 HSB25 HSB25 11441
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 year STD See attached
WARRANTY: LABOR 1 year
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a

6 Vacuum packaging machine Berkel 
Model No. 1005398 Berkel Number 
250 Machine vacuum packaging 
14X15X4"

1 $3,333.86 $3,333.86 $3,111.86 $3,111.86 $4,584.27 $4,584.27 $4,335.40 $4,335.40 $4,070.27 $4,070.27 $3,932.60 $3,932.60 $4,244.00 $4,244.00 $4,175.00 $4,175.00 $3,711.70 $3,711.70

48
49
50
51
52
53
54

Each
MANUFACTURER: Berkel Vollrath Berkel Berkel Berkel Berkel Berkel Berkel
MODEL NUMBER 250 40808 250 250 250 250 250 250
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year
WARRANTY: LABOR 1 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year 1 year
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) No n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a
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ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
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55
56
57
58
59
60
61
62

7 Table Top MTS Seating Model No. 
210‐36x36 to 51R Fold‐a‐Leaf® 
Table Top, Square to Round, 36" X 
36" square to 51" round, 1‐1/4" 
self edge, edge finish of laminate in 
same material as top surface, 1‐
1/8" core of premium grade 
particle board. 2 ea group I 
Wilsonart, std. (nc) 2 laminate to 
be specified and 2 each PDT ‐ base 
location pre‐marked with 
indentation, (1) mounting per top

2 $357.54 $715.08 no bid $0.00 $313.48 $626.96 $314.98 $629.96 $308.11*** $616.22 $328.13 $656.26 no bid $0.00 $315.00 $630.00 *$274.00 $548.00

Each
MANUFACTURER: MTS Seating MTS MTS MTS MTS MTS
MODEL NUMBER 210-36x36 210-36x36 5IR 210-36x36 5IR 210-36x36 5IR 210-36x36 210-36x36 
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 year STD see attached 1 year
WARRANTY: LABOR 1 year
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a

8 Table Base, metal. MTS seating 
Model No. CI‐28R‐4PC Table Base, 
round, 28", diameter base with 4" 
diameter column, dining height, 
powdercoat finish, recommended 
top sizes: 42" ‐ 60" 2 ea. M‐7 
Melatone ‐ Expresso

2 $164.30 $328.60 no bid $0.00 $145.14 $290.28 $144.74 $289.48 $155.71*** $311.42 $150.78 $301.56 no bid $0.00 $147.00 $294.00 $126.85 $253.70

63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70

71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78

79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86

p

Each
MANUFACTURER: MTS MTS MTS MTS MTS MTS
MODEL NUMBER Cl-28R-4pc CI 28R 4 pc CI 28R-4 PC CI 28R-4 PC CI 28R-4 PC CI 28R-4 PC
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 year STD see attached 1 year
WARRANTY: LABOR 1 year
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no

9 Cart, dish Cambro Model No. ADCS 
‐ 480 dish cart, adjustable, 6 
towers, minimum dish size 4‐1/2", 
maximum dish size 13", includes 
vinyl dust cover, polythylene 
construction, 28‐5/8"W x 37‐7/8"L 
x 31‐7/8" H, speckled gray, NSF

2 $545.74 $1,091.48 $590.28 $1,180.56 $640.33 $1,280.66 $540.54 $1,081.08 $745.74 $1,491.48 $582.12 $1,164.24 $682.40 $1,364.80 $602.50 $1,205.00 $556.13 $1,112.26

Each
MANUFACTURER: cambro Cambro Cambro Cambro Cambro Cambro Cambro Cambro
MODEL NUMBER ADCS-480 ADCS 480 ADCS 480 ADCS 480 ADCS 480 ADJW6 ADJW6 ADCS 480
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 year STD STD 1 year 1 year
WARRANTY: LABOR 1 year n/a n/a n/a n/a
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a n/a n/a n/a

10 Plate, China Cardinal Model, 2 dz. 
Per case. Plate, 10‐3/4" x 5‐1/8", 
rectangular, porcelain, Chef & 
Sommelier, Purity

10 $194.62 $1,946.20 $180.27 $1,802.70 $458.89 $4,588.90 $189.16 $1,891.60 no bid $0.00 $375.45 $1,877.25 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 $162.92 $1,629.20

DOZEN
MANUFACTURER: Cardinal Cardinal Cardinal Cardinal Cardinal
MODEL NUMBER 51063 S1063 S1063 S1063 S1063
WARRANTY: PARTS n/a STD
WARRANTY: LABOR n/a n/a
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a

11 Plate, China Oneida Model No. 
F5000000151S Plate, 10‐1/2", 

10 $230.34 $2,303.40 $220.31 $2,203.10 $553.17 $5,531.70 $245.32 $2,453.20 no bid $0.00 $176.01 $1,760.10 no bid $0.00 $180.25 $1,802.50 $197.56 $1,975.60

87
88
89
90
91
92
93
94

95
96
97

square, bright white, scratch‐
resistant glaze, polished foot, 
Porcelain undercorated, (open‐
stock, minimum=case quantity)

DOZEN
MANUFACTURER: Oneida Oneida Oneida Oneida Oneida Oneida
MODEL NUMBER F50000001625 F5000000151S F5000000151S F5000000151S 5000000151S-C5806 5000000151S-C5806 50000
WARRANTY: PARTS n/a STD
WARRANTY: LABOR n/a n/a
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a

12 Plate, China Oneida Model No. 
F5000000162S Plate, 11‐7/8", 
square, bright white, scratch‐
resistant glaze, polished foot, 
Porcelain undercorated, (open‐
stock, minimum=case quantity)

10 $275.53 $2,755.30 $265.02 $2,650.20 $661.71 $6,617.10 $293.45 $2,934.50 no bid $0.00 $210.55 $2,105.50 no bid $0.00 $214.25 $2,142.50 $236.32 $2,363.20

DOZEN
MANUFACTURER: Oneida Oneida Oneida Oneida Oneida Oneida
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98
99

100
101
102

103
104
105
106
107
108
109
110

111
112
113
114
115
116
117
118

119

MODEL NUMBER F5000000162S F5000000151S F5000000162S F5000000162S F500000012S F500000012S
WARRANTY: PARTS n/a STD
WARRANTY: LABOR n/a n/a
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a

13 China, Bowl Syracuse China Model 
No. 911195004 Rim Soup Bowl, 13 
oz., 9‐1/4", Contempra pattern, 
square shape, bone china body

10 $217.53 $2,175.30 $181.11 $1,811.10 $206.79 $2,067.90 $174.60 $1,746.00 no bid $0.00 $188.03 $1,880.30 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 $182.96 $1,829.60

DOZEN
MANUFACTURER: Syracuse Syracuse syracuse syracuse syracuse
MODEL NUMBER 911195004 911195004 911195004 911195004 911195004-C5903 91
WARRANTY: PARTS n/a STD 3 year chip
WARRANTY: LABOR n/a n/a
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a

14 China, bowl Syracuse China Model 
No. 905356902 Plate, 12‐1/4", 
Slenda pattern and shape, Royal 
Rideau body

10 $170.76 $1,707.60 $145.74 $1,457.40 $162.33 $1,623.30 $137.03 $1,370.30 no bid $0.00 $147.57 $1,475.70 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 $142.30 $1,423.00

Dozen
MANUFACTURER: Syracuse Syracuse syracuse syracuse syracuse
MODEL NUMBER 905356902 905356902 905356902 905356902 905356902
WARRANTY: PARTS n/a STD 3 year chip
WARRANTY: LABOR n/a n/a
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a

15 Induction Fry Pan Vollrath Pan Fry 
8" Stlcoat X3 SS Silico

2 $33.00 $66.00 $40.97 $81.94 $47.35 $94.70 $17.03 $34.06 $21.25**** $42.50 $33.65 $67.30 $24.37 $48.74 $47.00 $94.00 $44.19 $88.38

119
120
121
122
123
124
125
126

127
128
129
130
131
132
133
134

135
136
137
138
139
140
141
142

143
144
145
146
147
148
149
150

8  Stlcoat X3 SS Silico
Each

MANUFACTURER: Vollrath Vollarath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath
MODEL NUMBER 69108 47755 59900 67608 67608 X3SS Silico 67608 47755
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 year STD STD 90 day
WARRANTY: LABOR n/a n/a 1
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a 1

16 Induction Fry Pan Lincoln 
Foodservice Products Pan Fry 
Optio 11" 2" deep

2 $25.27 $50.54 $23.28 $46.56 $28.83 $57.66 $25.74 $51.48 $29.57**** $59.14 $18.20 $36.40 $34.25 $68.50 $26.00 $52.00 $56.67 $113.34

Each
MANUFACTURER: Vollrath Lincoln Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath
MODEL NUMBER N3811 N3811 N3811 N3811 N3811 K9617 N3811 N3811
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 year STD STD 1 year
WARRANTY: LABOR n/a n/a 1
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a 1

17 Induction Fry Pan Lincoln 
Foodservice Products Pan 12‐1/2" 
Induction Optio SS

2 $36.34 $72.68 $33.48 $66.96 $165.45 $330.90 $37.02 $74.04 $40.33**** $80.66 $28.25 $56.50 $44.76 $89.52 $37.00 $74.00 $62.72 $125.44

Each
MANUFACTURER: Vollrath Lincoln Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath
MODEL NUMBER N3812 N3412 N3812 N3812 K9611 N3812 N3812
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 year STD 1 1 year
WARRANTY: LABOR 1 year 1
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a n/a

18 Plate, China Imco Plate Sqr 10‐1/2" 
Wht Lakeview packed 6 per case

2 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 n/a $0.00 no bid $0.00 $43.56 $87.12 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00

Pks.
MANUFACTURER: Imco
MODEL NUMBER C6301
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

19 Platter China Imco Platter 12x5 2 no bid $0 00 no bid $0 00 no bid $0 00 n/a $0 00 no bid $0 00 $33 41 $66 82 no bid $0 00 no bid $0 00 no bid $0 00

151
152
153
154
155
156
157
158

159
160
161
162
163
164
165
166

19 Platter, China Imco Platter 12x5 
White Lakeview packed 6 per case

2 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 n/a $0.00 no bid $0.00 $33.41 $66.82 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00

Pks.
MANUFACTURER: Imco
MODEL NUMBER C6307
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

20 Plate, China Tuxton China Plate 12" 
Triangle White packed 6 per case

2 $50.42 $100.84 no bid $0.00 $45.65 $91.30 $18.00 $216.00 no bid $0.00 $57.54 $115.08 $50.49 $100.98 no bid $0.00 $9.17 $110.04

cs.
MANUFACTURER: Tuxton Tuxton Tuxton Tuxton Tuxton
MODEL NUMBER BWZ1248 BWZ-1248 BWZ-1248 CWZ 1248 CWZ 1248
WARRANTY: PARTS n/a STD
WARRANTY: LABOR n/a n/a
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) No n/a n/a
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167
168

169
170
171
172
173
174

175
176
177
178
179
180
181
182

183
184
185
186
187
188
189
190

21 Cutting board, San Jamar board 
cutting 18x24x1/2 Red

6 $20.92 $125.52 $22.49 $134.94 $58.56 $351.36 $23.53 $141.18 $29.46 $176.76 $18.65 $111.90 $38.44 $230.64 $27.00 $162.00 $26.98 $161.88

Each

MANUFACTURER:
San Jamar San Jamar San Jamar San Jamar Imco San Jamar 

CB182412RD
San Jamar 

CB182412RD
MODEL NUMBER CB182412RD San Jamar CB182412RD CB182412RD CB182412RD K4766
WARRANTY: PARTS CB182412RD 1 year STD
WARRANTY: LABOR n/a n/a
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) No n/a n/a

22 Piano wire whip Vollrath Model 
No. Whip Piano 12" Nylon Handle

4 $5.30 $21.20 $4.80 $19.20 $5.93 $23.72 $5.30 $21.20 $7.06**** $28.24 $5.37 $21.48 $7.65 $30.60 $7.00 $28.00 $6.00 $24.00

Each
MANUFACTURER: Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath
MODEL NUMBER 47003 47003 41003 41003 47003 K7621 47003 47003
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 year STD 1
WARRANTY: LABOR n/a n/a 1
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a n/a

23 Bun Sheet Pan Rack, Rubbermaid 
Commercial Cart Max Prep w/cut 
brd. Off White.

1 $296.80 $296.80 $310.34 $310.34 $344.96 $344.96 $294.00 $294.00 $384.00 $384.00 $322.00 $322.00 $465.12 $465.12 $432.70 $432.70 $286.67 $286.67

Cs.
MANUFACTURER: Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid
MODEL NUMBER 331600 Owht 3315000wht 331600 -Owht 331600 -Owht 3316000wht 3316000wht 9F00000wht
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 year STD 1
WARRANTY: LABOR n/a n/a 1
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a

24 Oven, Countertop, Electric Nemco  1 $962.82 $962.82 $947.02 $947.02 $1,098.33 $1,098.33 $939.31 $939.31 $1,016.62 $1,016.62 $1,025.23 $1,025.23 $1,095.00 $1,095.00 $985.00 $985.00 $912.00 $912.00

191
192
193
194
195
196
197

198

199

200

Oven, Countertop, Electric Nemco 
Food Equipment Model No. 6205 
(see specs.) Pizza Oven, electric, 
countertop, 2‐deck, brushed s/s 
front, top & sides, insulated, 
removable 19" cordierite decks, 
tubular heating elements, 
thermostatic controls 300‐700°F, 
60 min. bell timer, 6' cord & 5‐15P 
plug, 120V, 1800 watts, 15 amps, 
4"

$ $ $ $ $ , $ , $ $ $ , $ , $ , $ , $ , $ , $ $ $ $

Each
MANUFACTURER: Nemco Nemco Nemco Nemco Nemco Nemco Nemco Nemco
MODEL NUMBER 6205 6205 6205 6205 6205 6205 6205 6205
WARRANTY: PARTS 1 year STD 1 1 1 year
WARRANTY: LABOR 1 year 1 1 1 year
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N) no n/a n/a no no

Additional Information Labor to 
receive, 

uncrate and set 
in place 

smallwares will 
be left in 

original cartons 
for JJC to 

unpack

$786.50 *item #7 +$2.23 total of $4.46

**item #4 & #5 
pricing based 
on both being 

purchased 
together

***item #7 &#8 
pricing based 

on being 
purchased 

together
Items #15, 16, 
17, & 22 must 
b d d &

201
202
203
204
205
206
207
208
209
210
211
212
213

be ordered & 
shipped 
together

TOTAL $22,913.23 $17,192.50 $36,615.60 $23,671.01 $14,358.48 $22,260.60 $12,177.06 $16,741.90 $21,503.23
Certification of Bidder
Addendum Acknowledged

NO BID
Office Revolution
Advanced Technologies
Reinhart Food
Wenger Corp.
Business Office Systems
Mitylite
Canada Cutlery

NO
YES Yes

No Yes
Yes Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes
No

Yes
No

Yes
Yes

Yes
No
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A B C
Joliet Junior College
Bid: Culinary Arts Equipment
February 9, 2010 @ 2:00pm

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY
1 Display case, refrigerated deli True 

Distribution Model No. TDBD‐48‐2. 
Double duty deli case, see‐thru, 28 
cu. ft., Low‐E glass front & (2) rear 
doors, white aluminum interior 
with coved s/s floor, (1) full 
lengeth s/s/ shelf, (2) PVC coated 
wire shelves, exclusive front & rear 
interior lighting, 1/2 HP, 
115v/60/1, 14.2 amps. Self 
contained refrigeration with 
castors 4" (4) 

1

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

2 Blender, Food Vita‐Mix Model. 
Blender Food 64oz Vita Prep 3

1

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

V W X Y Z AA AB AC

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST
$3,522.00 $3,522.00 $3,604.00 $3,604.00 $3,510.90 $3,510.90 $3,600.00 $3,600.00

TRUE TRUE TRUE
TDBD-48-2 TDBD-48-2 TDBD-48-2

1 1 1
1 year 1 year 1 year

no

$494.70 $494.70 $505.00 $505.00 $389.20 $389.20 $600.00 $600.00

Vita-mix Vita-mix Vita-mix
H1005 1002 1005

1 1 1
1

n/a n/a n/a

Pasco BrokerageStrategic Equipment Supply Robert Gill & Co. Sam Tell

21
22

23
24
25
26
27
28
29
30

31
32
33
34
35
36
37
38

39
40
41
42
43
44
45
46

47

ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

3 Scale, Portion, Dial Type 
Rubbermaid Commercial Model 
No. 632SRW. Pelouze ® Scale, 
portion, dial type, top loading 
counter model, 30° angled rotating 

12

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

4 Saw, meat, Manual Food 
Machinery of America Model 
(11437) Handsaw, 25"

12

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

5 HSB25 (11441) Handsaw 
Replacement blade, 25"

12

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

6 Vacuum packaging machine Berkel 
Model No. 1005398 Berkel Number 
250 Machine vacuum packaging 
14X15X4"

1

n/a n/a n/a

$68.37 $820.44 $70.00 $840.00 $68.67 $824.04 $73.00 $876.00

Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid
632SRW 632SRW 632SRW

$26.80 $321.60 $27.95 $335.40 $21.09 $253.08 no bid $0.00

FMA FMA
HS225 HS225

$4.40 $52.80 $4.49 $53.88 $3.43 $41.16 no bid $0.00

FMA FMA
HSB25 HSB25

$3,813.52 $3,813.52 $4,375.00 $4,375.00 $3,892.35 $3,892.35 $4,515.00 $4,515.00

48
49
50
51
52
53
54

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

Berkel Berkel Berkel
250 250 250

1 year 1 year 1 year
1



1
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3
4
5
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Bid: Culinary Arts Equipment
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ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY

55
56
57
58
59
60
61
62

7 Table Top MTS Seating Model No. 
210‐36x36 to 51R Fold‐a‐Leaf® 
Table Top, Square to Round, 36" X 
36" square to 51" round, 1‐1/4" 
self edge, edge finish of laminate in 
same material as top surface, 1‐
1/8" core of premium grade 
particle board. 2 ea group I 
Wilsonart, std. (nc) 2 laminate to 
be specified and 2 each PDT ‐ base 
location pre‐marked with 
indentation, (1) mounting per top

2

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

8 Table Base, metal. MTS seating 
Model No. CI‐28R‐4PC Table Base, 
round, 28", diameter base with 4" 
diameter column, dining height, 
powdercoat finish, recommended 
top sizes: 42" ‐ 60" 2 ea. M‐7 
Melatone ‐ Expresso

2

V W X Y Z AA AB AC

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Pasco BrokerageStrategic Equipment Supply Robert Gill & Co. Sam Tell

$284.00 $568.00 $367.00 $734.00 $421.63 $843.26 $440.00 $880.00

MTS MTS MTS
210-36x36 210-36x36 210-36x36 

1
1

$155.20 $310.40 $155.00 $310.00 $193.75 $387.50 $250.00 $500.00

63
64
65
66
67
68
69
70

71
72
73
74
75
76
77
78

79
80
81
82
83
84
85
86

p

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

9 Cart, dish Cambro Model No. ADCS 
‐ 480 dish cart, adjustable, 6 
towers, minimum dish size 4‐1/2", 
maximum dish size 13", includes 
vinyl dust cover, polythylene 
construction, 28‐5/8"W x 37‐7/8"L 
x 31‐7/8" H, speckled gray, NSF

2

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

10 Plate, China Cardinal Model, 2 dz. 
Per case. Plate, 10‐3/4" x 5‐1/8", 
rectangular, porcelain, Chef & 
Sommelier, Purity

10

DOZEN
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

11 Plate, China Oneida Model No. 
F5000000151S Plate, 10‐1/2", 

10

MTS MTS MTS
CI 28R-4 PC CI 28R-4 PC CI 28R-4 PC

1
1

$604.52 $1,209.04 $569.00 $1,138.00 $566.53 $1,133.06 $695.00 $1,390.00

Cambro Cambro Cambro
ADCS 480 ADCS 480 ADCS 480

1
1

$188.00 $1,880.00 $215.00 $2,150.00 $179.13 $1,791.30 $275.00 $2,750.00

Cardinal Cardinal Cardinal
S1063 S1063 S1063

1

$253.98 $2,539.80 $245.00 $2,450.00 $241.34 $2,413.40 $240.00 $2,400.00

87
88
89
90
91
92
93
94

95
96
97

square, bright white, scratch‐
resistant glaze, polished foot, 
Porcelain undercorated, (open‐
stock, minimum=case quantity)

DOZEN
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

12 Plate, China Oneida Model No. 
F5000000162S Plate, 11‐7/8", 
square, bright white, scratch‐
resistant glaze, polished foot, 
Porcelain undercorated, (open‐
stock, minimum=case quantity)

10

DOZEN
MANUFACTURER:

Oneida Oneida Oneida
000151S-C5806 5000000151S-C5806 5000000151S-C5806

1

$305.24 $3,052.40 $289.55 $2,895.50 $288.69 $2,886.90 $295.00 $2,950.00

Oneida Oneida Oneida
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2
3
4
5
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ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY
98
99

100
101
102

103
104
105
106
107
108
109
110

111
112
113
114
115
116
117
118

119

MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

13 China, Bowl Syracuse China Model 
No. 911195004 Rim Soup Bowl, 13 
oz., 9‐1/4", Contempra pattern, 
square shape, bone china body

10

DOZEN
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

14 China, bowl Syracuse China Model 
No. 905356902 Plate, 12‐1/4", 
Slenda pattern and shape, Royal 
Rideau body

10

Dozen
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

15 Induction Fry Pan Vollrath Pan Fry 
8" Stlcoat X3 SS Silico

2

V W X Y Z AA AB AC

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Pasco BrokerageStrategic Equipment Supply Robert Gill & Co. Sam Tell

F500000012S F500000012S F500000012S
1

$188.90 $1,889.00 $187.00 $1,870.00 $180.44 $1,804.40 $400.00 $4,000.00

syracuse syracuse syracuse
1195004-C5903 911195004-C5903 911195004-C5903

3 year chip 1

$0.00 no bid $149.00 $1,490.00 $141.64 $1,416.40 $350.00 $3,500.00

syracuse syracuse
905356902 905356902

1

no bid $0.00 $18.50 $37.00 $41.90 $83.80 $50.00 $100.00

119
120
121
122
123
124
125
126

127
128
129
130
131
132
133
134

135
136
137
138
139
140
141
142

143
144
145
146
147
148
149
150

8  Stlcoat X3 SS Silico
Each

MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

16 Induction Fry Pan Lincoln 
Foodservice Products Pan Fry 
Optio 11" 2" deep

2

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

17 Induction Fry Pan Lincoln 
Foodservice Products Pan 12‐1/2" 
Induction Optio SS

2

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

18 Plate, China Imco Plate Sqr 10‐1/2" 
Wht Lakeview packed 6 per case

2

Pks.
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

19 Platter China Imco Platter 12x5 2

Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath
59900 59900 59900

1

no bid $0.00 $29.50 $59.00 $24.76 $49.52 $35.00 $70.00

Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath
N3811 N3811 N3811

1

no bid $0.00 $39.95 $79.90 $38.70 $77.40 $45.00 $90.00

Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath
N3812 N3812 N3812

1

no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00

no bid $0 00 no bid $0 00 no bid $0 00 no bid $0 00

151
152
153
154
155
156
157
158

159
160
161
162
163
164
165
166

19 Platter, China Imco Platter 12x5 
White Lakeview packed 6 per case

2

Pks.
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

20 Plate, China Tuxton China Plate 12" 
Triangle White packed 6 per case

2

cs.
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00 no bid $0.00

no bid $0.00 $81.30 $162.60 $69.47 $138.94 $110.00 $220.00

Tuxton Tuxton
CW2 1248 CW2 1248
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3
4
5
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ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY

167
168

169
170
171
172
173
174

175
176
177
178
179
180
181
182

183
184
185
186
187
188
189
190

21 Cutting board, San Jamar board 
cutting 18x24x1/2 Red

6

Each

MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

22 Piano wire whip Vollrath Model 
No. Whip Piano 12" Nylon Handle

4

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

23 Bun Sheet Pan Rack, Rubbermaid 
Commercial Cart Max Prep w/cut 
brd. Off White.

1

Cs.
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

24 Oven, Countertop, Electric Nemco  1

V W X Y Z AA AB AC

UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

Pasco BrokerageStrategic Equipment Supply Robert Gill & Co. Sam Tell

$23.02 $138.12 $27.60 $165.60 $21.87 $131.22 $40.00 $240.00

San Jamar 
CB182412RD

Stanton San Jamar 
CB182412RD

799-24RD
1

$5.26 $21.04 $6.40 $25.60 $6.02 $24.08 $10.00 $40.00

Vollrath Vollrath Vollrath
47003 47003 47003

1

$296.67 $296.67 $309.00 $309.00 $281.41 $281.41 $520.00 $520.00

Rubbermaid Rubbermaid Rubbermaid
331500wht 33150000wht 9F00000wht

$1,058.55 $1,058.55 $1,060.00 $1,060.00 $932.73 $932.73 $1,150.00 $1,150.00

191
192
193
194
195
196
197

198

199

200

Oven, Countertop, Electric Nemco 
Food Equipment Model No. 6205 
(see specs.) Pizza Oven, electric, 
countertop, 2‐deck, brushed s/s 
front, top & sides, insulated, 
removable 19" cordierite decks, 
tubular heating elements, 
thermostatic controls 300‐700°F, 
60 min. bell timer, 6' cord & 5‐15P 
plug, 120V, 1800 watts, 15 amps, 
4"

Each
MANUFACTURER:
MODEL NUMBER
WARRANTY: PARTS
WARRANTY: LABOR
ENERGY STARY QUALIFIED (Y/N)

Additional Information

$ , $ , $ , $ , $ $ $ , $ ,

Nemco Nemco Nemco
6205 6205 6205

1 1 1
1

201
202
203
204
205
206
207
208
209
210
211
212
213

TOTAL
Certification of Bidder
Addendum Acknowledged

NO BID
Office Revolution
Advanced Technologies
Reinhart Food
Wenger Corp.
Business Office Systems
Mitylite
Canada Cutlery

$21,988.08 $24,649.48 $23,306.05 $14,707.00 $30,391.00
Yes
No

Yes
No

Yes
Yes

Yes
No


