
Joliet Junior College
Bid for Printing of College Community Catalog 
(Summer / Fall 2010)
January 20, 2010 @ 2:00pm

Quantity Description Total Printing 
Cost

Delivery Costs to 
Joliet Post Office

Delivery Costs to 
Other Post Offices

Total Printing 
Cost

Delivery Costs to 
Joliet Post Office

Delivery Costs to 
Other Post Offices

Total Printing 
Cost

Delivery Costs to 
Joliet Post Office

Delivery Costs to 
Other Post Offices

Total Printing 
Cost

Delivery Costs to 
Joliet Post Office

Delivery Costs to 
Other Post Offices

Summer 2010
235,000 8" x 10.5" approx. finish (16 x 10.5 flat) 28 

inside pages plus cover.
$20,737.15 $550.00 $50.00 $38,356.00 $739.00 $397.00 $22,766.00 $1,050.00 $80.00 each drop $35,975.00 $400.00 $1,250.00

Optional:
32 inside pages plus cover $21,903.34 $550.00 $50.00 $38,638.00 $814.00 $448.00 $24,112.00 $1,050.00 $80.00 each $37,450.00 $400.00 $1,250.00
36 inside pages plus cover $23,190.23 $550.00 $50.00 $42,860.00 $878.00 $471.00 $26,134.00 $1,050.00 $80.00 each $44,325.00 $400.00 $1,250.00
40 inside pages plus cover $24,415.26 $550.00 $50.00 $44,302.00 $965.00 $538.00 $27,375.00 $1,050.00 $80.00 each $46,075.00 $400.00 $1,250.00
Incremental additional 4 pages $15.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $16.90 $78.00 $44.00 $10.25 $20.00 $25.00 $7.50/m $400.00 $1,250.00
beyond 40 (per thousand)
Incremental deduction 4 pages $12.87 $550.00 $50.00 $15.38 $78.00 $44.00 $7.25 7.35/m
from 28 (per thousand)
Cost to add each $110.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $161.90 $88.44 $25.00 $25.00 $145.00

additonal 1,000 copies
Fall 2010

235 000 8" x 10 5" approx finish (16 x 10 5 flat) 48 $26 861 30 $1 000 00 $50 00 $48 771 00 $1 097 00 $598 00 $30 280 00 $1 050 00 $80 00 each $49 675 00 $400 00 $1 250 00

Mignone Communications, Inc. VG Reed & Sons, Inc.Woodward Printing Performance Graphics

235,000 8  x 10.5  approx. finish (16 x 10.5 flat) 48 
inside pages plus cover.

$26,861.30 $1,000.00 $50.00 $48,771.00 $1,097.00 $598.00 $30,280.00 $1,050.00 $80.00 each $49,675.00 $400.00 $1,250.00

Optional:
52 inside pages plus cover $28,158.11 $1,000.00 $50.00 $53,624.00 $1,176.00 $649.00 $32,644.00 $1,050.00 $80.00 each $51,350.00 $400.00 $1,250.00
56 inside pages plus cover $29,381.14 $1,000.00 $50.00 $57,369.00 $1,264.00 $683.00 $33,970.00 $1,050.00 $80.00 each $53,075.00 $400.00 $1,250.00
Incremental additional 4 pages $15.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $16.82 $78.00 $44.00 $10.25 $20.00 $25.00 7.5m $400.00 $1,250.00
beyond 56 (per thousand)
Incremental deduction 4 pages $12.87 $1,000.00 $50.00 $3.27 $78.00 $44.00 $7.25 $7.44
from 48 (per thousand)
Cost to add each $130.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $211.48 $118.91 $20.00 $25.00 $196.00

additonal 1,000 copies

Additional Information

Certification of Bidder
Samples Included
Addendum Acknowledged x

x
x

x
x

x
x

x
x



Total Printing 
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Joliet Post Office
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Other Post Offices

Total Printing 
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Delivery Costs to 
Other Post Offices

Total Printing 
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$27,758.00 $1,690.00 $100.00 $28,401.19 $2,035.89 165.00 each $55,325.00 $2,940.00 $1,412.00 $38,435.00 $1,237.00 $560.00 $20,818.00 $450.00 $90.00

$31,036.00 $1,690.00 $100.00 $29,958.95 $2,035.89 165.00 each $57,750.00 $2,940.00 $1,412.00 $38,435.00 $1,237.00 $560.00 $22,018.00 $450.00 $90.00
n/a n/a n/a $31,589.59 $2,035.89 165.00 each $62,955.00 $2,940.00 $1,412.00 no bid no bid no bid $24,418.00 $450.00 $90.00

$35,793.00 $2,475.00 $100.00 $33,147.35 $4,071.77 165.00 each $65,380.00 $2,940.00 $1,412.00 $43,329.00 $1,237.00 $560.00 $25,618.00 $450.00 $90.00
$2,423.00 $465.00 $0.00 6.63 per m $68,240.00 $2,940.00 $1,412.00 21.00/m na na $1,400.00 $450.00 $90.00

$3,076.00 $0.00 $0.00 6.63 per m $52,925.00 $2,940.00 $1,412.00 6.00/m na na $800.00 $450.00 $90.00

$149.00 $0.00 $0.00 see attached 
pricing letter

$265.00 $169.00/m na na $125.00 $450.00 $90.00

$38 016 00 $2 880 00 $100 00 $36 262 87 $4 071 77 165 00 each $71 110 00 $2 940 00 $1 412 00 $46 224 00 $1 614 00 $560 00 $27 018 00 $450 00 $90 00

Warner PrintingCollege Publishing Evergreen Printing Company Chase P. Young Co. Darby Printing

$38,016.00 $2,880.00 $100.00 $36,262.87 $4,071.77 165.00 each $71,110.00 $2,940.00 $1,412.00 $46,224.00 $1,614.00 $560.00 $27,018.00 $450.00 $90.00

n/a n/a n/a $37,893.51 $4,071.77 165.00 each $76,425.00 $2,940.00 $1,412.00 no bid no bid no bid $28,218.00 $450.00 $90.00
$44,600.00 $2,880.00 $100.00 $39,451.26 $4,071.77 165.00 each $78,860.00 $2,940.00 $1,412.00 $49,185.00 $2,086.00 $560.00 $29,418.00 $450.00 $90.00
$3,298.00 $0.00 $0.00 6.63 per m $81,445.00 $2,940.00 $1,412.00 13.00/m na na $1,400.00 $450.00 $90.00

$2,223.00 $0.00 $0.00 6.63 per m $68,240.00 $2,940.00 $1,412.00 4.00/m na na $800.00 $450.00 $90.00

$149.00 $0.00 $0.00 see attached 
pricing sheet

$335.00 205.00/m na na $170.00 $450.00 $90.00

x x

bid on 24 pages not 28 pages, 
see numerous changes to bid 
noted on pricing sheet

x

x

x
x

x xx
x


