
Joliet Junior College
Quote for Promotional Items
Sept. 17, 2007 at 2:00 p.m.

Item Quantity Description Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 1,000

PaperMate Spirit Gel Pen - 
Amsterdam Printing Item #40807 
Retractable Paper Mate® Ball 
Point Pen; Black gel ink; Frosted 
white barrel with smoke trim. 
Imprint with one color. Imprint 
area: 1-1/2"W x 1/2"H: IMPRINT: 
www.jjc.edu/alumni 815-280-2218 $0.54 $540.00 $0.59 $590.00 $0.73 $730.00 $0.620 $620.00 $0.700 $700.00 $0.590 $590.00 $0.536 $536.00 $0.65 $650.00 $0.527 $527.00 $0.95 $950.00

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 1,000 ea Item #21410 1,000 ea 500 ea 980 ea * 500 ea 500 ea 

Set up = $30.00

2 1,500

PaperMate Spirit Gel Pen - 
Amsterdam Printing Item #40807 
Retractable Paper Mate® Ball 
Point Pen; Black gel ink; Frosted 
white barrel with smoke trim. 
Imprint with one color. Imprint 
area: 1-1/2"W x 1/2"H: IMPRINT: 
www.jjc.edu/alumni 815-280-2218 $0.54 $810.00 $0.59 $885.00 $0.73 $1,095.00 $0.615 $922.50 $0.680 $1,020.00 $0.56 $840.00 $0.536 $804.00 $0.63 $945.00 $0.53 $530.00 $0.82 $1,230.00

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 1,000 ea 1,000 ea 500 ea 1471 ea* 500 ea 1500 ea

Item #21410
(price s/b 
$795.00)

Set up = $30.00

3 50

64MB USB-Depot "Chicago" style 
USB Flash Drive, Material: Plastic; 
2.68"L x .78"W x .28"D; Imprint 
Area 1: Cap: 0.4" x 0.5"; Imprint 
Area 2: Body: 1.3" x 0.5"; Imprint 
with one color: Pantone 266 
Purple; Imprint: JJC Alumni Logo, 
www.jjc.edu/alumni - 815-280-
2218 $5.69 $284.50 $10.33 $516.50 $6.50 $325.00 $8.35 $417.50

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 50 ea 50 ea 1,000 ea no bid 100 ea 50 ea n/a 128MB minimum 1,000 min
Set up = $50.00 Ocean64

4 50

128MB USB-Depot "Chicago" style 
USB Flash Drive, Material: Plastic; 
2.68"L x .78"W x .28"D; Imprint 
Area 1: Cap: 0.4" x 0.5"; Imprint 
Area 2: Body: 1.3" x 0.5"; Imprint 
with one color: Pantone 266 
Purple; Imprint: JJC Alumni Logo, 
www.jjc.edu/alumni - 815-280-
2218 $7.81 $390.50 $13.33 $1,333.00 $12.400 $620.00 $14.000 $700.00 $13.38 $669.00 $8.25 $412.50 $11.09 $554.50 $11.46 $573.00 $16.67 $833.50

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 50 ea 50 ea 50 ea 100 ea 50 ea. 50 ea

Set up = $50.00 Ocean128

* see quote for additional 
notes

* see quote for additional 
notes/pricing

* see quote for additional 
notes

*see quote for additional 
notes

Does not make 64 MB 
anymore

See quote for add'l notes

See quote for add'l notes

Min order is 100

Min order is 100

Canada Mostin 
Trading Corp. Office Depot Inc. ePromos

Elite Medical 
Products, Inc. (dba 

Whatchmacallit 
Premiums) Fancy That

Robustelli 
Merchandise 

Services
Lin-Jen Promotions, 

Inc.Blue Sky Marketing
Albrecht & Co./ 

Proforma
The Artcraft 
Company iPromo LLC



5 50

256MB USB-Depot "Chicago" style 
USB Flash Drive, Material: Plastic; 
2.68"L x .78"W x .28"D; Imprint 
Area 1: Cap: 0.4" x 0.5"; Imprint 
Area 2: Body: 1.3" x 0.5"; Imprint 
with one color: Pantone 266 
Purple; Imprint: JJC Alumni Logo, 
www.jjc.edu/alumni - 815-280-
2218 $8.09 $404.50 $16.65 $832.50 $13.220 $661.00 $16.060 $803.00 $14.42 $721.00 $8.75 $437.50 $12.91 $645.50 $12.87 $643.50 $18.61 $930.50

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 50 ea 50 ea 50 ea 100 ea 50 ea 50 ea

Set up = $50.00 Ocean256

6 100

64MB USB-Depot "Chicago" style 
USB Flash Drive, Material: Plastic; 
2.68"L x .78"W x .28"D; Imprint 
Area 1: Cap: 0.4" x 0.5"; Imprint 
Area 2: Body: 1.3" x 0.5"; Imprint 
with one color: Pantone 266 
Purple; Imprint: JJC Alumni Logo, 
www.jjc.edu/alumni - 815-280-
2218 $5.59 $559.00 $9.66 $966.00 $7.80 $780.00 $5.80 $580.00 $7.66 $766.00

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 50 ea 50 ea 1,000 ea no bid 100 ea n/a 128MB minimum 1,000 ea
Set up = $50.00 Ocean64
(see costs)

7 100

128MB USB-Depot "Chicago" style 
USB Flash Drive, Material: Plastic; 
2.68"L x .78"W x .28"D; Imprint 
Area 1: Cap: 0.4" x 0.5"; Imprint 
Area 2: Body: 1.3" x 0.5"; Imprint 
with one color: Pantone 266 
Purple; Imprint: JJC Alumni Logo, 
www.jjc.edu/alumni - 815-280-
2218 $7.71 $771.00 $13.50 $1,350.00 $13.33 $1,333.00 $10.960 $1,096.00 $12.570 $1,257.00 $9.75 $975.00 $10.96 $1,096.00 $7.45 $745.00 $10.40 $1,040.00 $10.14 $1,014.00 $13.53 $14.30

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 50 ea 50 ea 50 ea 100 ea 50 ea 100 ea
Item #11 Set up = $50.00 Ocean128 s/b $1,353.00

(see costs)

8 100

256MB USB-Depot "Chicago" style 
USB Flash Drive, Material: Plastic; 
2.68"L x .78"W x .28"D; Imprint 
Area 1: Cap: 0.4" x 0.5"; Imprint 
Area 2: Body: 1.3" x 0.5"; Imprint 
with one color: Pantone 266 
Purple; Imprint: JJC Alumni Logo, 
www.jjc.edu/alumni - 815-280-
2218 $7.99 $799.00 $17.76 $1,776.00 $16.65 $1,665.00 $13.220 $1,322.00 $14.200 $1,420.00 $14.08 $1,408.00 $12.30 $1,230.00 $8.15 $815.00 $12.25 $1,225.00 $11.42 $1,142.00 $15.29 $16.06

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 50 ea 50 ea 50 ea 100 ea 50 ea

Item #14 Set up = $50.00
Alt. 512MB 
@ $14.38 $1,438.00 Ocean256 s/b $1,529.00

(see costs)

9 250

64MB USB-Depot "Chicago" style 
USB Flash Drive, Material: Plastic; 
2.68"L x .78"W x .28"D; Imprint 
Area 1: Cap: 0.4" x 0.5"; Imprint 
Area 2: Body: 1.3" x 0.5"; Imprint 
with one color: Pantone 266 
Purple; Imprint: JJC Alumni Logo, 
www.jjc.edu/alumni - 815-280-
2218 $5.59 $1,397.50 $9.50 $2,375.00 $7.50 $1,875.00 $5.65 $1,412.50 $7.11 $1,777.50

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 50 ea 50 ea 1,000 ea no bid 250 ea 50 ea - 128MB min. 1,000 ea

* see quote for additional 
notes

Does not make 64MB in this 
style

Does not make 64MB in this 
style

Min order is 100

N/A in 64 MB

N/A in 64 MB



Set up = $50.00 Ocean64
(see costs)

10 250

128MB USB-Depot "Chicago" style 
USB Flash Drive, Material: Plastic; 
2.68"L x .78"W x .28"D; Imprint 
Area 1: Cap: 0.4" x 0.5"; Imprint 
Area 2: Body: 1.3" x 0.5"; Imprint 
with one color: Pantone 266 
Purple; Imprint: JJC Alumni Logo, 
www.jjc.edu/alumni - 815-280-
2218 $7.71 $1,927.50 $12.03 $3,007.50 $13.33 $3,332.50 $10.870 $2,717.50 $12.590 $3,147.50 $9.75 $2,437.50 $10.96 $2,740.00 $7.00 $1,750.00 $9.86 $2,465.00 $9.93 $2,482.50 $13.35 $13.56

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 50 ea 50 ea 50 ea 250 ea 50 ea 500 ea
Item #10 Set up = $50.00 Ocean128 s/b $3,337.50

(see costs)

11 250

256MB USB-Depot "Chicago" style 
USB Flash Drive, Material: Plastic; 
2.68"L x .78"W x .28"D; Imprint 
Area 1: Cap: 0.4" x 0.5"; Imprint 
Area 2: Body: 1.3" x 0.5"; Imprint 
with one color: Pantone 266 
Purple; Imprint: JJC Alumni Logo, 
www.jjc.edu/alumni - 815-280-
2218 $7.99 $1,997.50 $16.15 $4,037.50 $15.79 $3,947.50 $11.580 $2,895.00 $14.500 $3,625.00 $14.08 $3,520.00 $12.30 $3,075.00 $7.70 $1,925.00 $12.13 $3,032.50 $11.19 $2,797.50 $15.31 $7,659.00

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 50 ea 50 ea 50 ea 250 ea 50 ea 500 ea min.

Item #13 set up = $45.00
Alt. 512MB 
@ $13.62 $3,405.00 Ocean256

(see costs)

12 500

Spot Pen - 4Imprint catalog #7649. 
Retractable pen has distinctive 
rubber grip spots for comfortable, 
non-slip hold. Medium-point black 
ink. Barrel Color: White. Grip and 
Clip Color: Blue; Imprinted with - 
Office of Student Activities, Joliet 
Junior College. $0.20 $100.00 $0.40 $200.00 $0.39 $234.00 $0.469 $234.50 $0.470 $235.00 $0.41 $205.00 $0.401 $200.50 $0.52 $260.00 $0.37 $185.00 $0.499 $249.50

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 1,000 ea 600 release 300 ea 500 ea 50 ea
Item #55160 Set up = $45.00

13 500

Anodized Carabiner Keyholder - 
4Imprint Catalog #1097; Size 5-
5/8" x 5/8" x 5/16"; Color: Gold; 
Strap color: gold or black; 
Imprinted with - JJC Student 
Activities. $0.37 * $180.00 $0.690 $345.00 $0.78 $390.00 $0.649 $324.50 $0.760 $380.00 $0.79 $395.00 $0.762 $381.00 $0.84 $420.00 $0.53 $265.00 $0.942 $471.00

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 500 ea 500 release 250 ea 500 ea 100 ea 500 to 2500
*USD Item #65073 Set up = $45.00

** Program pricing - 600 
pc required

**Program pricing - 500 
pc required



14 500

Banner / Flag Message Pen - 
Plastic Note: ePromos SKU 
#8817768; Ballpoint pen with 2-
1/4" W x 6" H pull-out banner; Pen 
with JJC logo; Logo Location: 
Banner - Front, 6" W x 2-5/8" H - 
Banner imprinted with JJC, Alumni 
and Foundation logos; Reverse 
side of Banner Imprinted with list of 
important SAVE THE DATE 
Information. $1.75 $875.00 $2.350 $1,175.00 $0.70 $350.00 $1.02 $510.00 $3.188 $1,594.00

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 10,000 ea 1,000 ea no bid 1,000 ea 500 ea 1,000 min. order 500 ea

Deliv 8 wk 8 wk cost*

Alt. deliv 4 
wk @ $1.19 $595.00

Alt. 4 wk cost 
@ $1.72 $860.00

15 750

Banner / Flag Message Pen - 
Plastic Note: ePromos SKU 
#8817768; Ballpoint pen with 2-
1/4" W x 6" H pull-out banner; Pen 
with JJC logo; Logo Location: 
Banner - Front, 6" W x 2-5/8" H - 
Banner imprinted with JJC, Alumni 
and Foundation logos; Reverse 
side of Banner Imprinted with list of 
important SAVE THE DATE 
Information. $1.69 $1,267.50 $2.250 $1,687.50 $0.70 $350.00 $1.02 $765.00 $2.824 $2,118.00

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 10,000 ea 1,000 ea no bid 1,000 ea 750 ea 1,000 min. order 750 ea.
Deliv 8 wk 8 wk cost*

Alt. deliv 4 
wk @ $1.19 $595.00

Alt. 4 wk cost 
@ $1.72 $1,290.00

16 1000

Banner / Flag Message Pen - 
Plastic Note: ePromos SKU 
#8817768; Ballpoint pen with 2-
1/4" W x 6" H pull-out banner; Pen 
with JJC logo; Logo Location: 
Banner - Front, 6" W x 2-5/8" H - 
Banner imprinted with JJC, Alumni 
and Foundation logos; Reverse 
side of Banner Imprinted with list of 
important SAVE THE DATE 
Information. $1.43 $1,430.00 $2.050 $2,050.00 $1.43 $1,430.00 $1.790 $1,790.00 $2.100 $2,100.00 $2.25 $2,250.00 $0.593 $593.00 $0.87 $870.00 $1.05 $1,050.00 $2.090 $2,090.00

EACH MINIMUM ORDER RUN 10,000 ea 1,000 ea 1,000 ea 1,000 ea 1,000 ea

Set up = $250.00 Deliv 8 wk 8 wk cost*

Alt. deliv 4 
wk @ $.974 $974.00

Alt. 4 wk cost 
@ $1.41 $1,410.00

Includes 1-color logo
Total $13,733.50 $14,241.00 $21,025.00 $13,203.00 $18,250.00 $20,118.50 $13,935.50 $8,402.50 Regular $17,758.50 $11,209.50 $18,169.42

No Bid:

*See Quote for USB 512MB 
pricing; 2-sample pens sent 

& brochures

(Line Item #15 pricing 
s/b $525.00 8-wk and 

s/b $892.50 4-wk)

USB Quoting Models TX110 
or 5W - Prices good this 
week only (see quote for 

delivery time)

*See Quote - No 64MB 
USB, 2% net 30 

discount*

* See Quote for shipping 
charges that will vary, etc. 
Quote shows $9,116.71 

which includes Sales Tax.

* 8-week overseas 
total is $16,343.50

#21007 * see quote for add'l 
notes

Not avail at 500 units

Not avail at 750 units

Prices do not include 
shipping (see quote for 

add'l notes on qty & 
descriptions)

Quote shows Grand 
Total = $18,249.50

All Quoted based on 1-color 
imprint & 1-location. Includes 
delivery & handling charges

Sub to similar item - see 
Quote; Item#Ban-8


