
JOLIET JUNIOR COLLEGE
REQUEST FOR QUOTE

POINT OF SALE SYSTEM
Q07012

JULY 30, 2007

Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost Unit Cost Total Cost

1 2

MODULAR STATION:  DELL GX740 SMALL FORM 
FACTOR CPU, TOUCH DYNMAIC PYRAMID 15" 
FLAT TOUCH SCREEN MONITOR W/ 
INTEGRATED MSR, THERMAL RECEIPT, PRINTER $0.0000 $0.00 $1,997.0000 $3,994.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00

EA

2 2 POSIFLEX CR4000 CASH DRAWER $0.0000 $0.00 $149.0000 $298.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00
EA

3 1
EPSON TMU220 DOT MATRIX KITCHEN PRINTER-
LAN $0.0000 $0.00 $443.0000 $443.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00

EA

4 1 METROLOGIC VOYAGER HH SCANNER $0.0000 $0.00 $237.0000 $237.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00
EA

5 2

TWO TOUCH SOFTWARE LICENSE-INCLUDES 
CARRY-OUT, DELIVERY, EMERGENCY 
RECOVERY, VIP AND FLOOR MANAGEMENT, 
TIME CLOCK, ENHANCED REPORTING, ETC. $0.0000 $0.00 $990.0000 $1,980.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00

EA

6 50 TWO TOUCH GIFT CARDS INCLUDING SET UP $0.0000 $0.00 $1.6500 $82.50 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00
EA

7 1 REMOTE ACCESS $0.0000 $0.00 $139.0000 $139.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00
EA

8 2
SYSTEM CONFIGURATION & HARDWARE 
INTEGRATION $0.0000 $0.00 $175.0000 $350.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00

EA

9 2 DELIVERY AND INSTALLATION PER STATION $0.0000 $0.00 $125.000000 N/C $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $283.68*
EA

10 1 MENU BUILD & HARDWARE $0.0000 $0.00 $465.0000 N/C $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00
EA

11 1 TRAINING & SUPPORT $0.0000 $0.00 $510.0000 N/C $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00
EA

12 1 WIRING $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00 $0.0000 $0.00
EA Not applicable

No Bid $7,523.5000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid Incomplete

Schweppe, Inc.Aidex Corporation Jamesco
Complete Industrial & 

Electric SupplyChicago Cash Register Food Services Inc. Fox River Foods, Inc.Digi-Key
JBH Technologies, 

Inc.Electri-Comm, Inc.
ITEM QTY DESCRIPTION

GRAND TOTALS

Prepared by:  Tamara Stroupe 7/30/2007


