
Joliet Junior College
Quote for Office Supplies
June 18, 2007 at 10:30 a.m.

ITEM DESCRIPTION QUANTITY COST TOTAL COST COST TOTAL COST COST TOTAL COST COST TOTAL COST COST TOTAL COST COST TOTAL COST COST TOTAL COST
1 3" White Ring Binder 300 2.52$       $756.00 3.60$       $1,080.00 2.80$       $840.00 2.80$       $840.00 1.56$       $468.00 2.95$       $885.00 $0.00

(UNV-20992) each Quill #7223WE (white) 
*See Notes on Bid

EA #WJL27608 School Smart 
#086384

2 10 Tab Table of Contents 13 37.52$     $487.76 60.60$     $787.80 47.37$     $615.81 60.68$     $60.68 -$        $0.00 49.62$     $645.06 $0.00
(AVE-11169) each BX Avery #11169 BX 1 Box 24 sets per box NO BID

3 Blue Letter File Folders 6 17.18$     $103.08 25.22$     $151.32 19.45$     $116.70 25.08$     $25.08 $0.00 23.35$     $140.10 $0.00
(SMD-12040) each BX Smead #12040 (blue) BX 1 Box 50 folders per box NO BID

4 White Ruled Writing Pads 25 3.49$       $10.47 6.79$       $169.75 7.15$       $178.75 6.96$       $20.88 5.19$       $129.75 7.10$       $177.50 $0.00
(UNV-11000) each

3 DZ Quill #742328/ per DZ Dozen
#DSL 08312 DZ 3 DZ #DSL 08312 School Smart 

#085271

5 100/Pk IBM Format 3.5" Disks 3 25.20$     $75.60 19.89$     $59.67 18.09$     $54.27 5.27$       $5.27 12.45$     $37.35 17.79$     $53.37 $0.00
(IVR-00303) each PK Imation #46606 PK 1 PK 100 Disks / PK x 2=100/PKSchool Smart 

#025903

6 Time Cards 1 $0.00 14.09$     $14.09 12.56$     $12.56 14.02$     $14.02 $0.00 13.62$     $13.62 $0.00
(TOP-1260) each NO BID BX 1 BX 500 / BX NO BID

7 Clip 3x4 Name Tag Holder 3 30.50$     $91.50 52.74$     $158.22 36.88$     $110.64 52.45$     $52.45 $0.00 46.05$     $138.15 $0.00
(AVE-74541) each BX Avery #CC104C (white) BX 1 BX 100 / BX NO BID

8 3x4 Name Tags 1 10.08$     $10.08 16.81$     $16.81 12.72$     $12.72 16.97$     $16.97 $0.00 13.79$     $13.79 $0.00
(AVE-5392) each BX Avery #5392 (white) BX 1 BX 300 / BX NO BID

9 Sharp Calculator 30 1.63$       $48.90 2.11$       $63.30 1.92$       $57.60 2.64$       $79.20 $0.00 1.89$       $56.70 $0.00
(SHR-EL233SB) each EA Sharp#EL233SB (white) EA NO BID

10 HP Laserject Cartridge 2 114.92$   $229.84 123.99$   $247.98 114.53$   $229.06 125.07$   $250.14 $0.00 117.75$   $235.50 106.11$   $212.22
(HEW-Q6511A) each EA HP #Q6511A (black) EA NO BID

11 Basic 104 Keyboard 15 $0.00 20.28$     $304.20 17.49$     $262.35 16.12$     $241.80 $0.00 16.79$     $251.85 $0.00
(FEL-9892901) each NO BID EA NO BID

12 Notebook Riser 15 20.69$     $310.35 33.59$     $503.85 25.17$     $377.55 24.21$     $363.15 $0.00 31.09$     $466.35 $0.00
(MMM-LX500) each 3M #LX500 (black) EA NO BID

13 Ivory Resume Paper 8 $0.00 8.46$       $67.68 8.10$       $64.80 8.41$       $8.41 $0.00 7.98$       $63.84 $0.00
(SOU-R141CF) each NO BID BX #SOU-R14ICF 1 PK 100 Sheets / PK NO BID

14 Bulk Copy Paper 1 $0.00 28.99$     $28.99 32.26$     $32.26 32.12$     $32.12 $0.00 31.69$     $31.69 $0.00
(UNV-21200) each NO BID Carton CTN 1 CT #DSL18511 ; 

5000 sheets/CT
NO BID

15 Economy Storage Files 2 $0.00 18.52$     $37.04 17.27$     $34.54 1.78$       $3.56 $0.00 16.95$     $33.90 $0.00
(UNV-95223) each NO BID Carton CTN FEL00703 NO BID

School Specialty
Markelz Office Products, 

Inc. CDS Office TechnologiesQuill Corporation Josco Office Supply
J-M Printers & Office 

Products
Prestige Office Products, 

Inc.



16 High Volume Pencil Sharpener 1 96.38$     $96.38 129.99$   $129.99 121.34$   $121.34 119.00$   $119.00 $0.00 130.29$   $130.29 $0.00
(EPI-1606) each EA Hunt #1606 (beige) EA NO BID

17 20 + 4 Free Highlighters 2 $0.00 13.64$     $27.28 7.79$       $15.58 13.56$     $27.12 $0.00 10.85$     $21.70 $0.00
(AVE-98189) pack(s) NO BID PK NO BID

18 Magazine Floor Stand 1 $0.00 239.26$   $239.26 187.10$   $187.10 237.94$   $237.94 $0.00 250.59$   $250.59 $0.00
(RUB-18845) each NO BID EA NO BID

19 Black Storage Cabinet 2 $0.00 318.42$   $636.84 243.78$   $487.56 266.51$   $533.02 $0.00 250.59$   $501.18 $0.00
(HON-SC1872P) each NO BID Price increase 7/1/07 EA NO BID

20 Toaster Oven 1 $0.00 58.24$     $58.24 49.85$     $49.85 63.82$     $63.82 $0.00 48.99$     $48.99 $0.00
(CCE-CC2844) each NO BID EA NO BID

21 Calculators 1 68.01$     $68.01 100.05$   $100.05 72.27$     $72.27 99.50$     $99.50 $0.00 89.59$     $89.59 $0.00
(CNM-MP49D) each EA Canon #MP49D EA NO BID

22 Phone Wipes 8 4.21$       $33.68 6.68$       $53.44 4.85$       $38.80 6.65$       $53.20 $0.00 6.09$       $48.72 $0.00
(FAL-DDFT) each EA Falcon #DDFT EA NO BID

23 Laptop Care Kit 6 6.54$       $39.24 8.54$       $51.24 7.36$       $44.16 10.52$     $63.12 $0.00 7.16$       $42.96 $0.00
(FAL-DCLT) each EA Falcon #DCLT EA NO BID

24 Slim Jewel Case Asst. CD-R 4 $0.00 17.18$     $68.72 15.62$     $62.48 19.19$     $76.76 $0.00 15.33$     $61.32 $0.00
(VER-94611) each NO BID PK 1 PK 25 EA / PK NO BID

25 2" Expanding File 1 $0.00 24.71$     $24.71 15.74$     $15.74 24.57$     $24.57 $0.00 22.05$     $22.05 $0.00
(SJP-S11600) each NO BID Box BX 1 BX 10 EA / BX NO BID

26 4" Expanding File 1 $0.00 26.72$     $26.72 16.86$     $16.86 26.57$     $26.57 $0.00 23.85$     $23.85 $0.00
(SJP-S11610) each NO BID Box BX 1 BX 10 EA / BX NO BID

27 6" Expanding File 1 $0.00 29.93$     $29.93 19.00$     $19.00 29.76$     $29.76 $0.00 26.71$     $26.71 $0.00
(SJP-S11620) each NO BID Box BX 1 BX 10 EA / BX NO BID

28 Storage Boxes 1 $0.00 51.56$     $51.56 40.79$     $40.79 3.16$       $3.16 $0.00 43.39$     $43.39 $0.00
(FEL-00724) each NO BID Carton CTN NO BID

29 Aqua Pop-up Notes 1 6.51$       $6.51 11.05$     $11.05 7.92$       $7.92 10.99$     $10.99 7.62$       $7.62 10.25$     $10.25 $0.00
(MMM-R440-AQSS) each PK 3M #R44OAQSS Pack PK 1 PK 5 pads / PK 4 x 4 PK/5 3M #076155

while supplies last

30 Fuchsia Pop-up Notes 1 6.51$       $6.51 11.05$     $11.05 7.92$       $7.92 10.99$     $10.99 $0.00 9.99$       $9.99 $0.00
(MMM-R440-FFSS) each PK 3M #R440FFSS Pack PK 1 PK 5 pads / PK NO BID

31 Canary Pop-up Notes 1 5.34$       $5.34 9.19$       $9.19 6.49$       $6.49 9.34$       $9.34 $0.00 8.39$       $8.39 $0.00
(MMM-R440-YSS) each PK 3M #R440YWSS Pack PK 1 PK 5 pads / PK NO BID

32 Eraser 3-Pk 2 0.61$       $1.22 4.15$       $8.30 3.21$       $6.42 4.47$       $4.47 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
(PEN-2E21BP3-KG) each EA Pentel #Z21 (white) PK 1 PK 3 EA / PK; #PEN-

2E21BP3-K6
NO BID NO BID

33 29 Color Marker Set 2 $0.00 22.39$     $44.78 18.25$     $36.50 22.24$     $22.24 16.52$     $33.04 19.99$     $39.98 $0.00
(SAN-30023) each NO BID ST 1 ST 29 Markers / ST #407495 while 

supplies last

34 Black Hanging Folder File 2 $0.00 16.99$     $33.98 8.61$       $17.22 13.92$     $27.84 $0.00 13.68$     $27.36 $0.00
(ESS-23013) each NO BID EA NO BID



35 File Tote 6 $0.00 15.49$     $92.94 10.57$     $63.42 14.22$     $85.32 $0.00 11.55$     $69.30 $0.00
(RUB-85824) each NO BID EA NO BID

36 Black Sorter with Drawer 1 $0.00 23.79$     $23.79 11.12$     $11.12 17.28$     $17.28 $0.00 16.38$     $16.38 $0.00
(ROL-62531) each NO BID EA NO BID

37 Black Pencil Holder 1 $0.00 2.99$       $2.99 1.73$       $1.73 2.45$       $2.45 $0.00 3.26$       $3.26 $0.00
(ROL-62557) each NO BID EA NO BID

38 2-Drawer Cube Black 1 $0.00 16.99$     $16.99 8.52$       $8.52 12.81$     $12.81 $0.00 11.65$     $11.65 $0.00
(ROL-9E5600BLA) each NO BID EA NO BID

39 15 Minute Charger 3 $0.00 39.99$     $119.97 30.46$     $91.38 34.82$     $104.46 $0.00 35.45$     $106.35 $0.00
(EVE-CH15MNCP4) each NO BID EA NO BID

40 Stapler 1 $0.00 6.79$       $6.79 4.59$       $4.59 6.14$       $6.14 $0.00 8.25$       $8.25 $0.00
(BOS-B2200-BK) each NO BID EA NO BID

41 Heavy Duty Electrical Pencil 1 $0.00 47.99$     $47.99 34.90$     $34.90 44.40$     $44.40 32.63$     $32.63 40.29$     $40.29 $0.00
Sharpener-Black (EPI-1744) each NO BID EA XACTO #033914

42 Calculator 2 $0.00 10.49$     $20.98 9.13$       $18.26 9.95$       $19.90 $0.00 9.05$       $18.10 $0.00
(TEX-T1-1795SV) each NO BID EA NO BID

43 Digital Camera 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 249.95$   $249.95 $0.00 298.35$   $298.35 $0.00
(S5200) each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

44 512MB Memory Stick 2 $0.00 $0.00 28.21$     $56.42 33.52$     $67.04 $0.00 28.19$     $56.38 $0.00
(SON-MSXM5125) each NO BID NO BID EA NO BID

45 Fax Toner 2 $0.00 96.59$     $193.18 90.37$     $180.74 105.00$   $210.00 $0.00 97.89$     $195.78 84.64$     $169.28
(SAV-9839) each NO BID EA NO BID

46 Printer Cartridge 5 86.13$     $430.65 98.99$     $494.95 83.72$     $418.60 87.27$     $436.35 $0.00 86.10$     $430.50 87.72$     $438.60
(HEW4096A) each EA HP #C4096A #HEWC4096A NO BID

47 Labels 5 41.18$     $205.90 58.99$     $294.95 51.99$     $259.95 57.67$     $288.35 $0.00 51.85$     $259.25 $0.00
(AVE-5962) each BX Avery #5962 (white) BX 1 BX 3500 Labels / BX NO BID

48 Bulk First Aid 1 $0.00 $0.00 14.85$     $14.85 24.34$     $24.34 $0.00 21.84$     $21.84 $0.00
(FAO-223-U) each NO BID NO BID NO BID

49 Wrist Rest 1 7.82$       $7.82 14.99$     $14.99 9.44$       $9.44 11.69$     $11.69 8.12$       $8.12 10.89$     $10.89 $0.00
(FEL-91137) each EA #91137 (blue) School Smart 

#081963

50 Gel Mouse Pad 1 7.82$       $7.82 14.99$     $14.99 9.44$       $9.44 11.69$     $11.69 4.89$       $4.89 10.89$     $10.89 $0.00
(FEL-91141) each  EA #91141Q (blue) School Smart 

#081964

51 Six Pocket Organizer 1 $0.00 32.99$     $32.99 23.23$     $23.23 31.72$     $31.72 $0.00 30.69$     $30.69 $0.00
(RUB-96060) each NO BID NO BID

No Bid:

 See Bid - #FUJI15747988 
(#S5200 discontinued / 

replaced by #S700) 



COST TOTAL COST COST TOTAL COST COST TOTAL COST COST TOTAL COST COST TOTAL COST COST TOTAL COST
$0.00 2.73$       $819.00 $0.00 2.19$       $657.00 $0.00 6.00$       $1,800.00

or

Samsill #18587 GBC#8313051 
must be 
purchased in full 
cartons of 12 
each

2.75$       $825.00
Samsill #11807

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 65.85$     $856.05

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 28.65$     $171.90

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 12.76$     $319.00

20.00$     $60.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 29.00$     $87.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 19.95$     $19.95

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 65.00$     $195.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 17.80$     $17.80

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 2.62$       $78.60

93.45$     $186.90 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 108.00$   $216.00 138.22$   $276.44

14.95$     $224.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 19.00$     $285.00 23.98$     $359.70

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 28.00$     $420.00 39.99$     $599.85

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 11.28$     $90.24

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 66.02$     $66.02

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 37.53$     $75.06

General Binding Corp.
Multiwave Education & 

Government Dept.
Gatekeepers Internet 

Marketing
Standard Stationary Supply 

Co. Cratex Corp.The Tree House Inc.



$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 167.14$   $167.14

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 14.10$     $28.20

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 267.98$   $267.98

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 384.30$   $768.60

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 66.58$     $66.58

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 127.46$   $127.46

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 7.19$       $57.52

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 11.89$     $71.34

10.75$     $43.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 21.00$     $84.00 20.40$     $81.60
(50 PK) #VER-94178

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 26.64$     $26.64

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 30.43$     $30.43

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 34.42$     $34.42

$0.00 $0.00 10.40$     $10.40 $0.00 $0.00 60.00$     $60.00
1 case-see attached newsletter

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 12.58$     $12.58

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 12.58$     $12.58

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 9.68$       $9.68

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 4.50$       $9.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 26.82$     $53.64

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 16.56$     $33.12



$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 14.93$     $89.58

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 22.40$     $22.40

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 5.78$       $5.78

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 17.19$     $17.19

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 45.00$     $135.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 13.50$     $13.50

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 48.04$     $48.04

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 11.25$     $22.50

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 355.39$   $355.39

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 33.71$     $67.42

84.00$     $168.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 98.99$     $197.98

76.40$     $382.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 89.00$     $445.00 118.93$   $594.65
#C4096A

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 68.40$     $342.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 25.73$     $25.73

8.90$       $8.90 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 13.00$     $13.00 14.06$     $14.06

9.95$       $9.95 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 12.00$     $12.00 15.00$     $15.00

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 36.90$     $36.90


