
Joliet Junior College
Bid for Basketball Equipment - Men's
April 27, 2007 at 10:00 a.m.

Anaconda Sports, Inc. Hayden's Sport Center Football America Eich's Sports, Inc. Salkeld Sports
ITEM QUANTITY DESCRIPTION UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST UNIT COST TOTAL COST

1 8

Rawlings NJCAA 
Basketballs; No 
Substitutes $28.19 $225.52 $29.95 $239.60 $27.88 $223.04 $30.00 $240.00 $35.46 $283.68

each VISNJCAA VIS NJCAA-B

2 8

A4 NF 1270 
Reversible Tanks 
(Purple/White) 1-Color 
Screened Logo on 
both sides - No 
Numbers; No 
Substitutes

each
1 Sizes: Large $12.49 $12.49 $11.00 $11.00 $9.61 $9.61 $11.00 $11.00 $18.33 $18.33
5 XL $12.49 $62.45 $11.00 $55.00 $9.61 $48.05 $11.00 $55.00 $18.33 $91.65
2 XXL $12.49 $24.98 $11.00 $22.00 $9.61 $19.22 $11.00 $22.00 $18.33 $36.66

Asspect 2-one color logos

3 22

A4 NF1264 
Reversible Practice 
Jersey (Purple/White) 
1-Colored Screened 
Logo on Both Sides - 
No Numbers; No 
Substitutes

each
3 Sizes: Large $13.09 $39.27 $14.00 $42.00 $12.74 $38.22 $13.75 $41.25 $19.85 $59.55
7 XL $13.09 $91.63 $14.00 $98.00 $12.74 $89.18 $13.75 $96.25 $19.85 $138.95
9 XXL $13.09 $117.81 $14.00 $126.00 $12.74 $114.66 $13.75 $123.75 $19.85 $178.65
3 XXXL $14.99 $44.97 $16.00 $48.00 $12.74 $38.22 $15.65 $46.95 $22.10 $66.30

4 20

A4 N 5262 Reversible 
Dazzle Mesh Short 
(Purple/White) 1-Color 
Screened Logo on Left 
Leg (Purple Site 
Only); No Substitutes

each
7 Sizes: XL $16.50 $115.50 $16.00 $112.00 $13.09 $91.63 $14.40 $100.80 $19.14 $133.98
10 XXL $16.50 $165.00 $16.00 $160.00 $13.09 $130.90 $14.40 $144.00 $19.14 $191.40
3 XXXL $17.99 $53.97 $18.00 $54.00 $13.09 $39.27 $16.25 $48.75 $21.39 $64.17

1-one color logo

5 22

A4 N4141 Fleece 
Hooded Pull Over 
(Black) 1-Color 
Screened Logo on 
Chest; No Substitutes

each
3 Sizes: XL $20.45 $61.35 $20.00 $60.00 $17.15 $51.45 $17.45 $52.35 $23.08 $69.24
14 XXL $20.45 $286.30 $20.00 $280.00 $17.15 $240.10 $17.45 $244.30 $23.08 $323.12
5 XXXL $22.50 $112.50 $22.00 $110.00 $17.15 $85.75 $20.55 $102.75 $25.33 $126.65

1-one color logo

6 20

A4 N 6132 Fleece 
Pant (Black) 1-Color 
Screened Logo on Left 
Leg; No Substitutes

each
3 Sizes: XL $16.99 $50.97 $17.00 $51.00 $14.02 $42.06 $14.30 $42.90 $19.14 $57.42
14 XXL $16.99 $237.86 $17.00 $238.00 $14.02 $196.28 $14.30 $200.20 $19.14 $267.96
3 XXXL $19.20 $57.60 $19.00 $57.00 $14.02 $42.06 $17.45 $52.35 $21.39 $64.17

1-one color logo

7 3

A4 3156 Polo (White) 
Embroidered on Left 
Chest; No Substitutes

each
1 Sizes: XL No Bid $19.95 $19.95 $18.89 $18.89 $19.00 $19.00 $29.17 $29.17
1 XXL No Bid $19.95 $19.95 $18.89 $18.89 $19.00 $19.00 $29.17 $29.17
1 XXXL No Bid $21.95 $21.95 $18.89 $18.89 $21.00 $21.00 $31.42 $31.42

1-embroidery
$1,760.17 $1,825.45 $1,556.37 $1,683.60 $2,261.64

NO BID:
Baum Sign Inc.
BSN Sports
Riddell Athletic Products
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