Joliet Junior College |
Quote for Football Supplies
March 3, 2004 10:00 a.m.
Salkeld Sports JJ Sport MECA Sportswear BSN Sports Hayden's Athletic Kirhofer's Sports Santo Sport Store Football American Riddell/All American
ITEM QUANTITY |[DESCRIPTION UNIT COST | TOTAL COST |UNIT COST |[TOTAL COST |UNIT COST |TOTAL COST UNIT COST |[TOTAL COST |UNIT COST TOTAL COST |UNIT COST |TOTAL COST |UNIT COST |TOTAL COST |UNIT COST [ TOTAL COST |UNIT COST |TOTAL COST
Mouth Pieces (Purple) Riddell 45791
1 250 or Equivalent $0.29 $72.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.38 $95.00 $0.50 $125.00 $0.28 $70.00 $0.22 $55.00 $0.26 $65.00
Each Adams MG 301 Adams Athletic Specialities Adams Adams
Twin City Pro KXL Tube Extra Large
2 100 Socks Black -RN35452 NO SUBS $3.36 $336.00 $3.50 $350.00 No Bid No Bid $3.40 $340.00 $4.60 $460.00 $3.38 $338.00 No Bid $3.59 $359.00
Pair Riddell/All American
Twin City Pro KXL Tube Extra Large
3 100 Socks White -RN35452 NO SUBS $3.36 $336.00 $3.50 $350.00 No Bid No Bid $3.40 $340.00 $4.40 $440.00 $3.23 $323.00 No Bid $3.59 $359.00
Pair Riddell/All American
4 25 Riddell Mesh Belts-Black WB52 $0.89 $22.25 No Bid No Bid $0.69 $17.25 $1.00 $25.00 $1.05 $26.25 $0.00 $0.60 $15.00 $0.92 $23.00
Each ProTeam FBP Alternate Athletic Specialties Football American Pub
Wilson 1001 NCAA Footballs Only-
5 36 Branded with Joliet Junior College $46.80 $1,684.80 $43.95 $1,582.20 No Bid No Bid $46.95 $1,690.20 $47.00 $1,692.00 $45.22 $1,627.92 No Bid No Bid
Each 1001 Wilson
Riddell Power Pads - Shoulder Pads -
6 5 Med. Receiver Type No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $67.00 $335.00 $176.00 $880.00
Pair Douglas DP Series
7 10 Riddell Revolution Special XL Helmets No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $183.50 $1,835.00
Each
Riddell Tag-TSF-871 Knee Pads
8 10 48120 $2.85 $28.50 No Bid No Bid $2.06 $20.60 $3.45 $34.50 No Bid $2.68 $26.80 $3.75 $37.50 $3.45 $34.50
Pair All-Star KP2000 Alternate Athletic Specialities Football American
9 50 Swivel T hook Shoulder Pad Clips No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.69 $8.69 $0.95 $47.50 No Bid No Bid $0.48\ $24.00 $0.48 $24.00
Each J1203 1-1/2 inch Black Swivel T-Hook Alternate Athl.Spec. Adams SPH-13 Riddell/American
10 30 Practice Pants Tag-Custom White $8.95 $268.50 $10.08 $302.40 $9.95 $298.50 $9.70 $291.00 $6.40 $192.00 $10.42 $312.60
Medium 10 TeamWear FPA
X-Large 10
XX-Large 10
Alternate Tag Custom Don Alleson Football American Riddell/American
Girdles-Da Don Alleson Spandex
11 35 Athletic
Medium 10 $11.95 $119.50 $13.50 $135.00 $11.42 $114.20 $12.00 $120.00 $11.40 $114.00 $10.84 $108.40 $9.95 $99.50 $13.59 $135.90
X-Large 10 $11.95 $119.50 $13.50 $135.00 $11.42 $114.20 $12.00 $120.00 $11.40 $114.00 $10.84 $108.40 $9.95 $99.50 $13.59 $135.90
XXX-Large |5 $14.95 $74.75 $15.50 $77.50 No bid $13.50 $67.50 $13.40 $67.00 $12.24 $61.20 $11.85 $59.25 $13.59 $135.90
XXXX-Large |10 $15.95 $159.50 $16.50 $165.00 No bid $16.50 $165.00 $14.40 $144.00 $12.99 $129.90 $13.45 $139.50 $14.59 $145.90
SportsBelle FGSP Don Alleson 695 Alternate Da Alleson Don Alleson Alleson 695 L Don Alleson Riddell/American
Practice Jerseys - Black Numbers
Front and Back TAG 160 Numbers
12 99 1-99 $13.85 $1,371.15 No Bid No Bid $13.06 $1,292.94 $19.00 $1,881.00 $12.10 $1,197.90 No Bid $10.95 $1,084.05 $12.65 $1,252.35
Each Sportsbelle - (3 prices) Alternate Don Alleson Don Alleson Riddell/American
Practice Jerseys - White Numbers
Front and Back TAB 160 Numbers 1
13 99 -99 $13.85 $1,371.15 No Bid No Bid $13.06 $1,292.94 $19.00 $1,881.00 $12.10 $1,197.90 No Bid $10.95 $1,084.05 $12.65 $1,252.35
Each Sportsbelle - (2 prices) Alternate Don Alleson Don Alleson
14 20 Chin Straps $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $8.00 $160.00 $6.75 $135.00 No Bid $5.25 $105.00 $6.74 $134.80
Each Athletic Specialties Adams Pro 100
15 63 Speedline MJ600-31/91 Pro Fit Body No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $90.00 $5,670.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each Speedline
16 100 Stripe Decals for Helmet Riddell $3.15 $315.00 No Bid $2.35 $235.00 No Bid $3.15 $315.00 No Bid No Bid $0.20 $20.00 $2.44 $244.00
Each Healy Pro Cals Pro Tuff E6000/00
17 125 "JJC" Logo Decals $2.09 $261.25 No Bid $3.25 $406.25 No Bid $2.90 $362.50 No Bid No Bid $1.20 $150.00 $3.05 $381.25
Each per pair Pro Cals Pro Tuff Riddell/American
18 500 Football Helmet Awards $0.22 $110.00 No Bid $0.28 $140.00 No Bid $0.24 $120.00 No Bid No Bid $0.17 $85.00 $0.24\ $120.00
Each Pro Cals Pro Tuff Riddell/American




JVC Super V.H.S. 120 V.C.R

19 100 Videotapes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each
JVC 120 SX High Performance Tapes-
20 40 08816-120 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Each
TOTAL: $6,650.35 $2,794.70 $781.25 $3,163.22 $13,732.70 $6,004.05 $2,793.62 $3,584.35 $7,830.45
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